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LOT #

Auction Policies1

All 55 stickers and the famous #207 C-3PO "error" card. Stickers
grade between 9 down to a couple of (AUTH)s. The error card is
graded SCG 6.

Star Wars 1977 SGC Graded Sticker Set + Error Card2

This set is complete and ready to play. It is in excellent condition in
the original insert boxes. This does not come with the original outer
shipping box and does not have any paperwork or certificate of
authenticity, but is guaranteed to be genuine.

Star Trek Tridimensional Chess Set Franklin Mint3

Group of official chase cards from various Star Trek trading card
sets with rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth
getting graded! This group includes: Jeri Ryan Voyager A7, Vaughn
Armstrong Nemesis RA10, Ron Perlman Nemesis NA2, Carolyn
Seymour Nemesis RA7, Fionnula Flanagan TNG Season 7 A11,
and JG Hertzler Enterprise A8.

Lot of 6 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards Jeri Ry4

This lot features over 2 and 1/2 long boxes of Star Trek comics
from the 1989 series.  includes the full run of the 1989 series with
at least one copies of each issue including all of the Annuals
(#1-6), Specials #1-3 and the full run of the 4 part series of the
Modala Imperative. Overall in the FN+ to VF+ range.

Star Trek (1989/DC) Full Run #1-80 + Annuals w/Man5

1st appearance of Beta Ray Bill. 2 copies. Both are newsstand
editions. FN+/VF- condition with some creasing and spots of
moisture damage.

Thor #337 (x2) 1st Beta Ray Bill/Newsstand Edition6

Original G1 Transformer. Light and sound works. Battery not
included. The figure has moderate to heavy wear with some
cracking and other playwear as pictured. This comes with the
original box and Styrofoam insert. The box has heavy wear as
pictured.

Shockwave G1 Transformer w/Box 1984/Works7

Made in 1989 at the time Star Trek V was released. This
Communicator set functions as Walkie talkies with 9-volt batteries
(not included). Model #652.  Tested and working!

Star Trek 1989 Communicator/Walkie Talkies Set8

LOT #

Lot includes Michael Dorn/Worf, John de Lancie/Q, Gates
McFadden/Crusher, Marina Sirtis/Troi, and more! No CoAs, but
Back to the Past believes these signatures to be genuine.

Star Trek Next Generation 8x10 Autograph Lot of 99

Includes Data as Sherlock Holmes, Geordi LaForge as Watson,
Captain Picard and Nurse Christine Chapel. New in sealed
packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Target Exclusive 9 inch Figure Lot10

CGC graded 6.0 (Qualified). Coupon cut out inside that does not
affect story. CGC graded comic.

Amazing Spider-Man #108 CGC 6.0 (1972)11

3 vehicles. All are new in packages. The packages have only been
opened for inspection and have not been removed from the plastic
bags or cardboard inserts. Packages have some light to moderate
shelf wear as pictured.

Star Wars X-Wing/AT-ST/Tie Fighter Lot12

First comic issue of the adaptation of the TV series. CGC graded
comic.

Battlestar Galactica #1 CGC 9.4 1979/Marvel13

Jon Kent reveals he is bisexual. CGC graded comic.
Superman: Son of Kal-El #5 CGC 9.8/Pride Variant C14

5 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the Special Edition U.S.S.
Enterprise with Lights and Sounds (#6957), U.S.S. Excelsior
(#6630), U.S.S. Reliant (#8766), Special Edition Galileo II
Shuttlecraft (#6007), and the U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge
(#6007). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot15

New in sealed package. 1997, Playmates. The batteries appear to
be dead and will need to be replaced to restore electronic
functions. As such, this is being sold as is. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek U.S.S. Defiant NX-74205/Playmates16

Set of 9 figures with an extra Gul Dukat and Security Chief Odo.
New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Deep Space Nine Set of 9 Figures + More17
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LOT #

Skifell and Pallantides of the Black Dragons. New in sealed
packages.

Conan McFarlane Action Figure Lot18

8 officially licensed ties. All are in nice shape with little wear as
pictured.

Star Trek Ralph Marlin Neckties Lot of (8)19

Group of official chase cards from Star Trek sets with rare
autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth getting graded!
This lot includes: James Doohan/Scotty Star Trek Autograph Series
A2, and Grace Lee Whitney/Rand Star Trek Autograph Series A5.

Lot of 2 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards James D20

Original Crew & The Next Generation. Banners are complete.
Some storage wear as pictured.

Star Trek On Video 10 Foot Vinyl Banner (x2, 1992)21

All 12 issues of the 2nd Miles Morales series. Includes 2 copies of
#3. Overall NM- to NM range.

Miles Morales: The Ultimate Spider-Man #1-12/Set22

Volume 2 #1 issue. CGC graded comic.
Red Sonja #1 CGC 8.5 (1983) John Buscema Cover23

Lot includes a Ferengi Fighter and 4 figures (Lt. Tash Yar, Lt.
Geordi LaForge, Lt. Worf and Commander Riker). 1988. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG Galoob Ferengi Fighter + Figures Lot24

First appearance of Sage and Taranto. CGC graded comic.
Groo the Wanderer #1 CGC 9.0 1982/Pacific Comics25

Stealth Predator Collector's Club exclusive from Movie Maniacs
series V and Liens Warrior Alien figure. New in sealed packages.

Predator + Alien Figures/McFarlane w/Club Exclusiv26

Lot includes Billy Mumy of Lost in Space, Hudson Leick/Callisto
from Xena, Nicholas Brendon/Xander from Buffy the Vampire
Slayer, and more! No CoAs, but Back to the Past believes these
signatures to be genuine.

Lot of 7 Popular TV 8x10 Autographs Buffy Xena Her27

This lot includes the U.S.S. Voyager Crew Diorama with Neelix and
Odo Miniature Figurines. Made by Applause.  New condition in
packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Voyager Dioramas + Figurine Lot28

This lot features a long box of Voyager #1-15 set, Deep Space
Nine #1-15 set, the Telepathy War #1, Voyager False Color,
Avalon Rising, and Babylon 5 #1,2,4-10 as well as TNG First
Contact Movie Adaptation, TNG Operation assimilation Special,
TNG Killing Shadow #1-4, and TNG Perchance to Dream #1-4.
Marvel, DC and Wildstorm comics.  This lot contains a many
duplicate copies of the issues listed. Overall VF to VF+/NM-
condition.

Star Trek Deep Space Nine/Voyager Comic Runs + Mor29

LOT #

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:
U.S.S. Enterprise model kit with fiber optic lights (#8772), Klingon
Battle Cruiser (#6812), Cardassian Glaor Class Ship (#8324),
Runabout Rio Grade (#8741), U.S.S. Defiant (#8255) and Security
Officer Odo (#8761). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG + DS9 Model Kits Lot30

20 figures from Playmates. New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek The Next Generation/Generations Figure L31

One-shot by Frank Miller set in the future timeline of The Dark
Knight Returns. CGC graded comic.

Dark Knight Returns: The Golden Child #1 CGC 9.832

(10) 9 inch figures from various Warp Factor series. New in sealed
packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Warp Factor Series 9 inch Figures Lot33

The 2021 series was the first Alien series published by Marvel with
new concepts and Aliens! Complete sets of the #1-12 series, the
#1-6 series and a single copy of #3 from the 2023 series from
Marvel. Overall NM- to NM range.

Alien #1-12 (2021)/Alien #1-6 (2022) #3 (2023) Mar34

Each kit is 12" tall when built. Kits are all new in box and unbuilt.
Star Trek TNG Geometric Model Kit Lot Data/Riker/P35

Borg Temple, Klingon Great Hall, Enterprise NCC-1701-D, Klingon
Bird of Prey and as well as the Starfleet Away Tem and Borg
Assimilation Team. New in sealed packages. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Strike Force Figures/Playset/Ships36

3rd printing variant. CGC graded comic. Comic case has some
scratches as pictured.

Batman #24 CGC 9.4 Foil Variant/Batman Proposes37

Stan Lee stories. Human Torch/Spider-Man cover by Larry Lieber
and Mike Esposito. CGC graded comic.

Amazing Spider-Man Annual #4 CGC 3.0 (1967)38

1993. The tape was loose on the package, so we opened it up for
inspection. It is in new condition. It was not removed from the
inserts. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek The Next Generation Bridge Playset/Playm39

Don't overlook this one! Cards G1-G9 from Star Trek Deep Space
9 "Memories from the Future" in the rare gold chase card limited
edition. #893 of 999. Overall sharp NM cards with a few minor
imperfections.

Star Trek DS9 Greatest Moments GOLD Card Set of 940

Figure comes in a McFarlane fishtank display case. Excellent
condition. Nice shape.

McFarlane X-Files Flukeman Special Ed. Figure w/Di41

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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30 comics. Includes Nice House on the Lake #1-12 (set), Strange
Adventures #1-12 (set) the Question #1-4 (set) and Batman
Damned #2 (x2 with 2 different covers). Overall Nm- to NM range.

DC Black Label Comic Lot Damned/Nice House On Lake42

X-Cutioner's Song Part 3. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #14 CGC 8.5/X-Cutioner's Song43

1985/86 Kenner MASK vehicle and figure set. Vehicle and figure
appear in nice shape and all of the mechanisms function normally.
Box is complete with cardboard insert. Vehicle and figure appear in
overall nice shape with little playwear as pictured. Box has
moderate shelf wear. Comic book #1 and poster included, but
instruction sheet is not.

M.A.S.K. Switchblade w/Figure and Box44

6 AMT/Ertl and Monogram sealed model kits. Includes the
Cut-Away U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1701 (#8790), Klingon Cruiser
(#8229), U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge (#6007), Deep Space
Nine Space Station (#8778), Voyager Maquis Ship (#3605) and
Voyager Kazon Ship (#3606). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot45

Picard, Riker, Worf, Data and Geordi LaForge. New in sealed
packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Insurrection 12 inch Figure Set of 546

Included are issues #1, 18,21(x2),25,30,32,59-61 and Annual #1.
#1 (VF+/NM- condition) is the 3rd team appearance of the New
Mutants. #21 is the first time Illyana Rasputin is referred to as
Magik, in a character bio. #25 is the 1st cameo appearance of
Legion. #32 is the introduction of the island of Madripoor. #60 is
the death of Cypher. Annual #1 is the first appearance of Lila
Cheney. Overall VF/VF+ to NM condition.

New Mutants Group of (11) #1-61 w/Annual #147

Art Thibert cover. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #13 CGC 9.6/Hazardous Territory48

56 comics from various series. Read the full description for all of
the issues included and highlights. Includes lots of convention
exclusives and variant covers as well as tie-ins and more. Lot
includes Dark Nights Metal #1-6 (12 comics w/all different covers),
The Batman Who Laughs #1,2,3,5,6 (9 comics w/all different
covers), Batman the Red Death #1 (3 covers), The Curse of
Brimstone #1, Batman Lost #1, Hawkman Found #1, Batman the
Merciless #1, Batman the Drowned #1, Dark Nights Batman Who
Laughs #1, Batman the Dawnbreaker #1 (2 covers), The Grim
Knight #1 (2 covers), Death Metal #2 (2 covers), #7, Batman the
Murder Machine #1 (2 covers), Batman the Devastator #1 (2
covers), The Casting #1 (3 covers), The Forge #1 (4 covers), The
Forge/The Casting Director's Cut, Year of the Villain #1, Damage
#3, Flash #33, Justice League #32, Hal Jordan Green Lantern #32,
Justice League #33, Nightwing #29, Green Arrow #32 and Suicide

Batman Who Laughs/Dark Nights Metal Mega Lot49

LOT #
Squad #26. Some of the highlights include: Dark Nights Metal #2 is
the 2nd cameo appearance of the Dark Multiverse Batmen: The
Drowned, The Dawnbreaker, The Red Death, The Batman Who
Laughs, The Merciless, The Devastator, The Murder Machine and
the first appearance of Baby Darkseid. Batman the Red Death #1
is a one-shot featuring a Batman/Flash Dark Multiverse hybrid.
Suicide Squad #26 has a cover cameo appearance of The Batman
Who Laughs. Green Arrow #32 is the 2nd full appearance of The
Batman Who Laughs. Overall NM- to Nm condition.

A long box full of 4 different 1990s series. Includes a near run of
Starfleet Academy (#1-19, missing #12), Star Trek Unlimited Near
Run (#1-10, missing #5 and 6), Early Voyages Near Run (#1-17,
missing #16), the Untold Voyages #1-5 set Mirror Mirror Special
and  Star Trek/X-Men. Most series have more than one copy of
each issue listed. Overall VF to VF+/NM with a few as low as FN.

Star Trek Unlimited/Academy/Untold + Early Voyages50

29 comics. Includes Dark Avengers #1-6, 9-16 with Annual #1 and
Uncanny Avengers #1-10,12,13 and 15 with an extra copy of #4.
Dark Avengers #1 is the first appearance of the Dark Avengers.
Uncanny Avengers is the first appearance of the Unity Squad and
the S-Men. Overall VF to NM condition.

Dark Avengers + Uncanny Avengers Comic Book Lot51

New in sealed package. Includes Phaser, Communicator, Belt and
8 interactive missions.

Star Trek (2009 Movie) Starfleet Command Mission U52

12 figures from various Warp Factor series. Includes the Target
exclusive Picard! New in sealed packages. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Warp Factor Series Figures Lot w/Exclusi53

Iconic cover art by Jim Lee. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #11 CGC 9.8/Jim Lee Cover54

67 sealed figures and vehicles from 2009. 8 ships and 8 figures
made up the set. This lot has 2 complete sets and lots of extras.
Includes Kirk (x6), Bones (x5), Scotty (x3), Uhura (x3), Chekov (x3),
Sulu (x8), Spock (x3), Spock Prime (x4), U.S.S. Enterprise (x3),
U.S.S. Kelvin (x9), Warbird (x3), Spock's Ship (x2), Shuttle (x3),
Tricorder (x3), Communicator (x6), and Hover Bike (x3).

Star Trek Burger King Premium Toys Large Lot w/Set55

Lot includes #1 (sealed with Stimpy air fouler),2,,4-19,Marvel Age
#121 (Ren and Stimpy cover), Powdered Toast Man #1, (2) trade
paperbacks and a 5 comic sealed lot. It contains an issue of Ren
and Stimpy #1, Bill and Ted's Excellent Adventure #1 and Pirates
of the Dark Water #4,5, and 6. NM-/NM overall.

Ren and Stimpy Comic/TPB + More Lot56

Fantastic Four #631/Phil Noto Marvel 80th Anniversary variant
cover. CGC graded comic.

Fantastic Four #6 CGC 9.8 Noto 80th Anniversary Va57

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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First appearance of Maverick. 2nd appearance and 1st full cover
appearance of Omega Red. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #5 CGC 9.6/1st Maverick58

3 sets. Includes the 170 Collector Series, Starfleet Command
Target exclusive Kirk and Spock Interphase set and the Borg Drone
and Picard as Locutus of Borg Target exclusive set. New in sealed
packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Multi-Figure Pack Lot w/Exclusives59

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:
Special Edition 3-Piece U.S.S. Enterprise Chrome Set (#6005),
Klingon Bird of Prey (#8230), 3 Piece Adversary Set (#6858),
Space Ship Set (#6677), First Officer Mr. Spock (#8704) and
Security Chief Odo (#8761). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot60

3 sets. Each set features 16 different vehicles. New in sealed
packages. Galoob.

Star Trek Micro Machines Collector's Sets I II and61

18 vehicles. New in sealed packages. Includes the set of 8
Avengers Age of Ultron vehicles, the Star Wars set of 8 vehicles,
an extra Black Widow car and a Gamora car from Guardians of the
Galaxy.

Hot Wheels Avengers/Star Wars Die-Cast Vehicle Lot62

Sideshow Toys 12 inch figure. New in sealed package. See
pictures for package condition.

X-Files Frank Black 12" 1:6 Scale Figure/Sideshow63

Includes all 22 parts of the epic X themed crossover event.
Includes the Prelude (Excalibur #12). Overall NM- to NM condition.

X of Swords #1-22 Set w/Prelude (2020) Marvel64

Lot includes Terry Farrell/Dax x2, Marc Alaimo/Gul Dukat, and
Barbara March + Gwynth Walsh/Lursa + B'Etor the Klingon sisters
of House Duras. No CoAs, but Back to the Past believes these
signatures to be genuine.

Star Trek DS9 8x10 Autograph Lot of 4 Terry Farrel65

43 comics. Lot includes X-Men (2019) #1-12,16-21,X-Men (2021)
#1-7 with additional #1 variant cover by Peach Momoko featuring
Sunfire, Immortal X-Men (2022) #1-11, Planet-Size X-Men #1 and
4 Giant-Size one-shots (Nightcrawler, Fantomex, Magento, and 2
different covers for Jean Grey/Emma Frost). Overall VF+/NM- to
Nm condition.

X-Men (2019-2023) Comic Lot/Immortal/Giant-Size/Mo66

11 First Contact movie figures from the Playmates series. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek First Contact Full Set of 11 Figures67

Lot includes 2 Generations Advance posters, a Generations
personality poster, promotional Enterprise D and Deeps Space
Nine cut-away posters and an Enterprise D blueprint poster from

Star Trek Poster Lot/Promo/Movie/More68

LOT #
1992. Overall nice shape with some light edge wear to a couple of
the posters. Suitable for framing.

1987 issue. Thor gets new body armor. Iceman appearance. CGC
graded comic.

Thor #378 CGC 9.4 Buscema Cover69

Lot includes the U.S.S. Enterprise NCC 1701-D Blueprints set by
Rick Sternback and the Starfleet Academy Roleplaying game. Both
are sealed.

Star Trek TNG Blueprints + Academy RPG70

32-page promotional release with details about the two-month long
event Future State. CGC graded comic.

DC Nation Presents: Future State #1 CGC 9.871

Target exclusive Seven of Nine and Spencer Gifts exclusive Riker
and Picard. New in sealed packages. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek TNG Seven of Nine/Picard/Riker 9 inch Fi72

20 figures from various Star Trek series from Playmates. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot73

42 comics. #40 comes with standard and Spider-Verse variant
covers.  Overall NM- to NM condition.

X-Force (2019) #1-12/15-42/Annual #1 + Variant74

8 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the U.S.S. Enterprise Flight
Display (#8787), Klingon Bird of Prey Flight Display (#6339),
U.S.S. Excelsior (#6630), Original Edition Klingon Cruiser (#6743)
and (4) of the original crew 12" models (Captain Kirk #8773, Mr.
Scott #8777, Mr. Spock #8704, and Doctor McCoy #8774).
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot75

Lot includes (2) die-cast Enterprise figurines from Galoob, (6)
die-cast Enterprise Ertl figurines that we obtained at the
Smithsonian gift shop and (2) plastic Applause Enterprise figurines.
All are new in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Die-Cast + Plastic Enterprise Figurines76

#93 is the 1st cameo appearance of M.O.D.O.K., voice only and
mentioned by name. #98 is the first battle of Captain America vs
Black Panther and the 1st full appearance of Whitney Frost,
identity not revealed, later known as Madame Masque. #99 is the
final issue in the series. GD to VG- condition.

Tales of Suspense #93/95/98/99 1st M.O.D.O.K. Came77

1st team appearance of the X-Men Gold (team): Storm, Archangel,
Colossus, Iceman and Jean Grey and 1st team appearance of the
X-Men Blue (team): Cyclops, Wolverine, Gambit, Rogue, Psylocke
and Beast. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #1 (1991) CGC 9.8/Cover C/Jim Lee78

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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Allfather Build-A-Figure series. New in sealed package. Package
condition as pictured.

Marvel Legends Thor Infinite Series Avengers Figur79

6 AMT/Ertl and Monogram model kits. Includes U.S.S. Enterprise
from Star Trek IV (#6693-10D0), Klingon Bird of Prey Plus Pack
(#8015), U.S.S. Voyager (#3604), Runabout Rio Grande (#8741),
Klingon Crusier (#6682) and Klingon Crusier (#8229). Boxes are
not sealed, but the kits are unbuilt. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships Model Kit Lot80

Kenner, 1985. Piranha is complete with figure. It comes with the
original box and cardboard insert. The vampire is complete. It
comes with the box (no insert) and a poster/catalog. Comic book is
missing. The vehicles and figure appear in overall nice shape with
some decal wear as pictured. The boxes have moderate shelf
wear. These do not come with instruction sheets.

M.A.S.K. Piranha + Vampire Vehicles w/Figure and B81

This includes the set of 8 figures as pictured from Star Trek
Insurrection. Playmates. New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Insurrection 9 inch Figure Set of 882

Gabriele Dell Otto Loot Crate Edition variant cover. CGC graded
comic.

Star Wars #1 (2015) CGC 6.5  Dell Otto Variant83

2nd appearance of Sersi. CGC graded comic.
Eternals #4 CGC 9.2 1976/2nd Sersi84

Treebeard with Merry & Pippin from Lord of the Rings: The Two
Towers produced by Applause, LLC in 2002. Figure set is in nice
shape. Opened for inspection. Package condition as pictured.

Lord of the Rings Treebeard w/ Merry & Pippin Figu85

1st team appearance of the X-Men Gold (team): Storm, Archangel,
Colossus, Iceman and Jean Grey and 1st team appearance of the
X-Men Blue (team): Cyclops, Wolverine, Gambit, Rogue, Psylocke
and Beast. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #1 (1991) CGC 9.8/Cover D/Jim Lee86

Lot includes #54,72,73,74,81,84,85,86, and #153. The origin of
Wolverine and Weapon X begins in issue #72 (VF/VF+ condition).
Overall VF/VF+ to NM.

Marvel Comics Presents Group of (9) #72-153/Key We87

First Officer Donatello/Spock. Playmates, 1994. New in sealed
package. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek/Teenage Mutant Ninja Turtles Donatello F88

3 copies. This was the first ongoing Black Panther solo title. 1st
team appearance of the Collectors: Abner Little and Princess
Zanda. NM- condition.

Black Panther #1 (x3)(1977) Jack Kirby!89

LOT #

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL and Monogram. Included are
the following:  U.S.S. Enterprise from Star Trek IV the Voyage
Home (#6693-10D0), Legendary Space Encounter (#8254),
Voyager Maquis Ship (#3605), U.S.S. Enterprise (#6676), First
Officer Mr. Spock (#8704) and Security Chief Odo (#8761).
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot90

1st team appearance of the X-Men Gold (team): Storm, Archangel,
Colossus, Iceman and Jean Grey and 1st team appearance of the
X-Men Blue (team): Cyclops, Wolverine, Gambit, Rogue, Psylocke
and Beast. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #1 (1991) CGC 9.8/Collectors Cover E/Jim Lee91

6 figures from the 1979 Mego series. Overall they appear to be in
good shape with some varied playwear as pictured.

Buck Rogers 1979 Mego Figure Lot of (6)92

Group of official chase cards from various Star Trek trading card
sets with rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth
getting graded! This Lot includes: A15 William Campbell, A16 Gary
Lockwood, A18 Stewart Moss, A19 Madlyn Rhue, A20 Malachi
Throne, A21 Morgan Woodward, A22 Meg Wyllie, A24 Michael J.
Pollard, and A26 Sherry Jackson.

Lot of 9 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards93

2 McFarlane figures. The Spawn series 1 figure was signed by Al
Simmons at a convention. This signature does not come with a
certificate of authenticity, but is believed to be genuine by Back to
the Past. Packages have shelf wear as pictured.

Spawn Series 1 Figure Al Simmons Signed + Cosmic A94

Verified autograph by writer Ed Brisson (comes with certificate of
authenticity). CBCS graded comic. This issue was the premiere of
the fifth Uncanny X-Men series.

Uncanny X-Men #1 Signed by Ed Brisson CBCS 8.595

5 PC games and other software. All are new in sealed boxes. Star
Trek Away Team (Activision), Star Trek Hidden Evil (Activision),
Star Trek Starship Creator, Starship Creator Warp II and Star Trek
Conquest Online (Activision).  Please note that these were
originally purchased in the late 90s, early 2000s, so please check
to make sure that you have the correct PC requirements to use
these items.

Star Trek Games and Software Lot96

Todd McFarlane cover art. CGC graded comic.
Batman #576 CGC 9.4 Batman Year Two Part Two97

2 vehicles. The Enterprise is from the Space Talk series. The
Goddard has been opened, but is in excellent condition and
complete. Both vehicles will need new batteries to restore
electronic functions. They are being sold as is. Boxes have some
shelf wear as pictured.

Star Trek The Next Generation Enterprise + Shuttle98

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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Over 70 Dark Horse Aliens and Predator comic books from various
series. Highlights include Aliens (1989) #2-6), Batman Versus
Predator #1-3 (deluxe edition), the Aliens Book One first edition
TPB from 1990 and more. Includes some duplicate issues. Aliens
Volume 1 #2 is a 3rd print, the 3rd issue is a first print. #4 comes
with 1st and 2nd prints. #5 and 6 are first prints. VF- to VF+/NM-
condition.

Alien/Predator Comic Book Lot99

26 comics. This series ran 18 issues. You get all but #3, 13 and 15.
Includes 5 copies of #1, 2 copies of #8,10,11,1216 and 17. Overall
Fan/VF+ to VF+/NM-, with a few as low as VG.

Star Trek (1979) Marvel Comics Near Run100

USS Enterprise NCC-1701-E. 21 inches long. Tested and working.
Made by Wesco. Runs on 3 AAA batteries (not included.

Star Trek Insurrection USS Enterprise 1998 Illumin101

Includes U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1701, NCC-1701-C, the Scorpion
from Nemesis and U.S.S. Franklin from Stare Trek Beyond. Each
has Magic Light. The NCC-1701 features lights and sound. Tested
and working. Ornaments are in great shape. Packages have some
varied shelf wear as pictured.

Star Trek Hallmark Ornaments Lot102

12 issues including #622-633. Keys include #622 which marks the
first appearance of Ikol- a future Loki who is an echo of Loki's
younger self, and #633 the first appearance of Thori, the
Hel-Hound. NM condition.

Journey Into Mystery Fear Itself + Shattered Heroe103

Verified autograph by the legendary Mike Grell. CBCS graded
comic.

Shaman's Tears #1 Signed by Mike Grell! CBCS 9.2104

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:
U.S.S. Enterprise model kit with fiber optic lights (#8772), Klingon
Battle Cruiser (#6812), Cardassian Glaor Class Ship (#8324),
Runabout Rio Grade (#8741), U.S.S. Defiant (#8255) and Security
Officer Odo (#8761). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG + DS9 Model Kits Lot105

31 issues of the 2020 series. The #1 issue is variant cover #1M
(Chip Kidd die-cut variant, NM condition). Overall NM- to NM.

Wolverine #1-5 + #8-33 w/Chip Kidd Die-Cut Variant106

Lot includes the Classic Board Game from 1992 (sealed), The Next
Generation Matching Game (sealed), the set of (6) Skybox Movie
trading cards sets (each set is sealed), a deck of playing cards
(unopened) and a Collector's edition Uno game (opened, but
complete and in excellent condition). Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Board Game/Card Game/Trading Cards Lot107

LOT #

21 comics. Includes Spawn #285 (4 different covers),
#301,311,32,313 (2 different cover), 314-318, King Spawn #1-6
and Spawn/Batman #1. Overall NM condition.

Spawn Modern Comic Lot w/Variants108

32-page promotional release with details about the two-month long
event Future State. CGC graded comic.

DC Nation Presents: Future State #1 CGC 9.8109

20 figures from various Star Trek series from Playmates. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot110

Han Solo, Boba Fett and Yoda. Each comes with an exclusive cup.
New in sealed packages.

Star Wars Figures w/Cup Sets Lot111

Lot includes: 2 different Original Series 30th Anniversary Metal
card sets (20 card and 6 card) , Star Trek Distinguished Officers
Series (5 metal cards), Star Trek the Next Generation Stardisc
Coins sealed box, and The Making of Star Trek the Next
Generation Skybox Collector 100 card set (open for inspection, but
complete).

Star Trek Collector Cards/Sets and More112

Borg Temple, Enterprise NCC-1701-D, Ferengi Marauder, Maquis
Fighter and as well as the Starfleet Away Team and Klingon
Warriors. New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Strike Force Figures/Playset/Ships113

24 comics. Lot includes the full set of Dune House Atreides with #1
die-cut cover variant and #3 1:25 retailer incentive variant as well
as Dune A Whisper of Caladan Seas #1, Dune Blood of the
Sardaukar #1, Dune The Waters of Kanly #1-4, Blade Runner
Origins #1-5 and Blade Runne 2039 #1. Overall NM condition.

Dune/Blade Runner Comic Lot w/Variants114

Verified autograph by writer Scott Snyder. CBCS graded comic.
Nocterra #1 Signed by Scott Snyder CBCS 9.4115

5 figures. Includes (2) 12" figures (McCoy and Kirk), (2) 6 inch
scale figures (Cadet McCoy and Uhura) and 3.75" Kirk figure. New
in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek 2009 Movie Action Figure Lot116

11 posters. Lot includes a Star Trek the Experience Las Vegas
Poster, a Galaxy Quest mini poster with mini frisbee, a Jackass the
Movie poster, Children of Dune promotional poster, (5) early 1980s
Star Wars premium posters that were mounted on cardboard. Each
measures 18 x 24 inches. Tack holes are present in the corners.
Also included are 4 laminated Star Trek themed posters for a
movie, books, and more. Overall good shape with some varied
wear.

Sci-Fi and More Promotional Poster Lot117

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #

Lot includes a Lieutenant Commander Deanna Troi figure signed
by actress Marina Sirtis, a Lieutenant Worf figure signed by actor
Michael Dorn and 2 Doctor Phlox figures signed by actor John
Billingsley. All are new in packages. These were convention signed
and do not come with certificates of authenticity, but Back to the
Past believes them to be genuine. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Autographed Action Figures Lot of (4)118

Playmates vehicles. The Excelsior has been opened for inspection
and is in new condition and works. The Bird of Prey is sealed. Both
should get new batteries to restore optimal electronic functions.

Star Trek U.S.S. Excelsior and Romulan Bird of Pre119

6 AMT/Ertl and Monogram sealed model kits. Includes the
Cut-Away U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1701 (#8790), Klingon Crusier
(#8229), U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge (#6007), Deep Space
Nine Space Station (#8778), Voyager Maquis Ship (#3605) and
Voyager Kazon Ship (#3606). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot120

Vehicle and figure are complete except for Dusty's mask. The box
comes with the original cardboard insert. Vehicle and figure appear
in overall nice shape. Box has light shelf wear as pictured. The
comic book, poster insert and  instruction sheet are not included.

M.A.S.K. Gator w/Figure and Box 1985/Kenner121

Art Adams Wraparound variant cover. CGC graded comic.
Avengers #0 CGC 9.6 Art Adams Variant Cover122

Lot includes Kate Mulgrew/Janeway, Tim Russ/Tuvok, Robert
Picardo/Doctor, Robert Duncan McNeill/Paris, Roxann
Dawson/Torres, and 2x Ethan Phillips/Neelix. No CoAs, but Back
to the Past believes these signatures to be genuine.

Star Trek Voyager 8x10 Autograph Lot of 7 Kate Mul123

Included is a complete set of Alien Beans with extra Vulcan and
Klingon Targ and a Vulcan Teddy Bear. The Beans all have their
original tags. Overall nice shape with some varied shelf wear as
pictured.

Star Trek Plush Toy Lot Alien Beans and More124

This lot features more than a long box full of Malibu Deep Space
Nine comics. This includes the entire 32 issue run of the Malibu
series with loads of duplicate issues as well as ones shots (Worf,
Terok Nor, Annual #1, Special, Blood and Honor, Ultimate Annual,
Rules of Diplomacy, Lightstorm) as well as the Hearts and Minds
and Maquis: Soldier of Peace Limited series. Includes many, many
duplicate issues and some variant covers. Overall VF+ to NM, with
a few as low as FN.

Star Trek Deep Space Nine Malibu Run + Many Extras125

Verified autograph by Everette Hartsoe on the Combo Gold Edition
variant. CGC graded comic.

Morbid Angel #1/2 Variant Signed by Everette Harts126

LOT #

20 comics. Includes Static #1-4, Icon #1-5, Hardware #1-5 and
Blood Syndicate #1-6. Stactic #1 (VF+ condition) is the 1st
appearance of Static Shock, the first black superhero to star in his
own cartoon series. Overall VF to VF+/NM- range.

DC Milestone Comic Lot with Static #1127

Volume two #1 from 1984. CGC graded comic.
Micronauts #1 CGC 9.6 Michael Golden Cover128

26 comics. Lot includes Doomsday Clock #1-12 set with an
additional variant cover for #1, extra copies of #8 and 9, Heroes in
Crisis #1-9 set with an extra copy of #7 and Rorschach #1 (DC
Black Label). Overall NM condition.

DC Doomsday Clock Set + Heroes In Crisis Set + Mor129

Lot of (3) gliders. Playmates, 1993.New in sealed packages.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG Starship Enterprise Glider (x3)130

10 vehicle sets. All are sealed. You get all pictured. Package
condition varies as pictured.

Star Trek Micro Machines Vehicle Sets Lot131

1st appearance of Spawn, Malebolgia, and Sam & Twitch. CGC
graded comic.

Spawn #1 CGC 9.4/1st Appearance of Spawn132

Lot includes a 1986 Aliens Warner Book Novel, AMT/Ertl Alien
Model (#30096), 2 sets of Star Wars Micro Machines, 2 Scooby
Doo ornaments, a Snoopy ornament, Captain America ornament,
Star Wars AT-ST Structors model, a vintage E.T. pull string talking
figure (works), an Anakin Skywalker Pod Racer Taco Bell cup, Star
Trek TOS Crew Member's Exploration Pack,  a Star Trek The
Motion Picture 70mm Film Cel, A Spider-Man and William Shatner
paperback and a Star Trek electronic game. Most of the items
come in or with the original packages. Items and packages have
varied wear as pictured.

Sci-Fi Collectibles/Toy Lot Aliens/Star Wars/E.T.133

This lot includes all 82 cards and 11 stickers cards from the 1984
Topps set as well as 14 of the 16 stickers from Kellogg's. The
vintage cards and stickers appear to be overall EX to EX/MT
condition. Some single cards/stickers may grade higher or lower.

Gremlins 1984 Topps Card/Sticker Set + More134

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:  3
Piece U.S.S. Enterprise Set (#6618), Klingon Bird of Prey (#8230),
Original Edition Klingon Crusier (#6743), Star Trek the Motion
Picture Klingon Crusier (#6682), Space Ship Set (#6677) and Chief
Engineer Mr. Scott (#8777). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot135

Lot of (3) figure sets. Includes a total of 9 figures from the New
Hope, Empire Strikes Back and Return of the Jedi series. This is
called the DVD collection, but DVDs were not included as stated on

Star Wars Saga Commemorative Multi-Pack Figure Set136

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #
the packages. New in sealed packages.

This group includes 6 trading cards (not chase cards) from Star
Trek sets that were taken to conventions and signed by John de
Lancie, famous as Q in the Next Generation. Overall NM cards with
a few imperfections. There is no CoA included, but Back to the
Past believes them to be genuine.

Lot of 6 Star Trek Cards Signed by John de Lancie/137

7 Star Trek movie limited edition pewter ships figures. Includes
Kirk, Spock (x2), and the Enterprise based on the 1979 Star Trek
the Motion Picture, Khan based on the 1982 Star Trek II and the
Bird of Prey based on the 1984 Star Trek III. New in packages.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Pewter Starships and Figures Lot138

Omega Red appearance. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #19 CGC 9.8/Omega Red Appearance139

Lot of (7) 12" figures. Includes Christopher Pike, Sulu, Kirk as a
Romulan, Spock, Andorian Ambassador Shras, Scottie and the
Mugato. All are new in sealed packages.

Star Trek 12" Figure Lot/Classic Edition + Aliens140

#34 (VG condition) is the 1st appearance of the Living Laser and
#41 (VG- condition) is the debut artwork on the Avengers by John
Buscema. #66 is GD condition.

Avengers #33/34/41 (1966) 1st Living Laser + More141

Darth Vader and Yoda vs. Sidious. New in sealed packages.
Star Wars Unleashed Action Figure Lot142

2nd appearance and 1st cover appearance of Fantomex. CGC
graded comic.

New X-Men #129 CGC 9.6/1st Fantomex Cover143

New in sealed package. 1995, Playmates. This still works, but we
recommend replacing the batteries to achieve optimum function.

Classic Star Trek Science Tricorder144

First cameo appearance of Apocalypse. CGC graded comic.
X-Factor #5 CGC 9.6/1st Apocalypse Cameo145

Lot includes a Starfleet Uniform (presumed to be Adult Woman's
Small to Medium, wristwatches, Spock ears, Communicator
Badges, Lanyards with ID badges and a Kraft mail-away
marshmallow dispenser.  Everything but the uniform, lanyards and
uniform are new in sealed packages. The uniform is in overall nice
shape with light wear and no tears.

Star Trek Cosplay Lot w/Uniform and More146

20 figures from various Star Trek series from Playmates. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot147

24 comics. Includes modern Marvel #1 issues with lots of variant
covers. You get all pictured! Overall NM- to NM.

Marvel Comics #1 Issues + Variants Comic Lot148

LOT #

The highlights of this lot includes Batman #89 (NM condition, 1st
Punchline cameo with variant cover art by Francesco Mattina),
Batman #655 (NM condition, 1st cameo appearance of Damian
Wayne, the son of Bruce Wayne and Talia al Ghul, in shadows),
Artgerm Catwoman covers and more! Overall VF to NM.

Batman and Related Modern Era Comic Lot w/Variants149

5 AMT/Ertl model kits. Includes the Special Edition U.S.S.
Enterprise with Lights and Sounds (#6957), U.S.S. Excelsior
(#6630), U.S.S. Reliant (#8766), Special Edition Galileo II
Shuttlecraft (#6007), and the U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge
(#6007). All are sealed except for the Special Edition U.S.S.
Enterprise with Lights and Sounds (#6957 but it is complete and
unbuilt. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot150

This 3/4 full long box of comics feature William Shatner's Tek
World #1-24 near run (missing only #4), Episode Guides #1-2,
Elftrek #1-2, Original and New Crew Personality Comics, Marvel
Vision TNG cover, a few parody/spoof comics, Walter Koenig's
Raver #1-3, Gene Rodenberry's Lost Universe #1-7 set, and
Leonard Nimoy's Primortals #1-5 + 7. Most of the Tek World,
Raver, Lost Universe and Primortals comics have some duplicate
copies of many issues. Overall VF to NM.

Star Trek Cast Inspired+ Personality/Parody Comics151

8 figures. Admiral Kirk, Khan, Commander Kruge, Lt. Saavik (x2),
Lt. Sulu (x2) and Lt. Uhura (x2). New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Classic Star Trek Movie Series Action Figure Lot152

Vehicle and figure with mask are complete with original box and
cardboard insert. The poster insert is not included. Overall this lot
appears in nice shape with little shelf/playwear as pictured. This
does not come with an instruction sheet.

M.A.S.K. Manta w/Figure and Box 1987/Kenner153

All 12 parts of the crossover story arc. Overall NM condition.
House of X #1-6 + Powers of X #1-6/Hickman154

Opened only for inspection. Excellent condition with stand. Missing
certificate of authenticity.

Star Trek Enterprise NX-01 Franklin Mint Pewter Sc155

This short box features mostly Sci-Fi comics from the Bronze to
Modern age. Includes titles like, Battlestar Galactica, Rocketeer,
Blade Runner, Terminator, Invaders from Mars, Disney's the Black
Hole, Forbidden Planet, Alien Nation and more. FN/VF to VF+/NM
condition.

Sci-Fi and More Short Box of Comics156

2 life-sized promotional standees promotion Star Trek the Next
Generation video collections. These standees come in the original
shipping box and are in excellent condition.

Star Trek TNG 1994 Picard and Riker Video Collecti157

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #

Made by Art Asylum. This has been tested and works, but sounds
weak. As this is sealed, it will need to be opened to replace the
batteries to restore optimal function. New in sealed package.

Star Trek Tek Enterprise Phase Pistol Communicator158

Set of 9 figures with an extra Lt. Dax and a Jake Sisko Figure. New
in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Deep Space Nine Set of 9 Figures + More159

Lot includes Walter Koenig/Chekov, George Takei/Sulu, Gary
Lockwood, Marlena Moreau, France Nuyen, and Lawrence
Montaigne x2. No CoAs, but Back to the Past believes these
signatures to be genuine.

Star Trek Original Series 8x10 Autograph Lot of 7160

Silver foil logo. #2339. Adventure Comics, 1991. CGC graded
comic.

Miss Fury #1 CGC 9.6/Numbered Edition161

Includes Battlestar Galactica (full original series), Lord of the Rings
(FOTR, 5 disc set w/bookends, sealed), Enterprise Seasons 1-4
(sealed), King Kong and King Kong Production Notes (2005,
complete with bonus items), Pirates of the Caribbean At World's
End DVD set with figure, Defenders of the Earth complete series
(sealed) and Fantastic Four Rise of the Silver Surfer figure with
Digital Comics DVD.

Pop Culture TV and Movie DVDs and More Lot162

10 comics with lenticular (flicker) covers. You get all pictured. NM
condition.

Marvel Legacy 3-D/Lenticular Cover Variant Lot163

Chris Claremont story. Art Adams cover. CGC graded comic.
Excalibur Mojo Mayhem #nn CGC 9.2/Claremont Story164

5 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL and Monogram. Included are
the following:  U.S.S. Enterprise from Star Trek VI (#8617), Klingon
Bird of Prey (#8230), Voyager Kazon Torpedo ((#85-3608), Doctor
Leonard McCoy (#8774) and U.S.S. Enterprise (#6676). Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot165

Kirk, Spock and Chekov in Environmental Suits. 1998, Playmates.
New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Target Exclusive 9 inch Figure Set166

28 comics. Lot includes the Spider-Man Versus Wolverine Special,
Wolverine Origins #11, 13 and 13 ( #11 is the 1st Daken, not in
disguise), Wolverine (2033) #49,51, Daken Dark Wolverine #1,
Wolverine #4 from the 2010 series, Wolverine Noir #1, Bloodlust
prestige format, Weapon Plus #1, and 18 issues from the 1988
series (#3,42,46, and 91-105). #100 features a hologram cover.
Overall NM- to NM condition.

Wolverine Past to Present Comic Lot/1st Daken + Mo167

LOT #

New in sealed package. The batteries have died and will need to
be replaced to restore electronic functions. 1994, Playmates.

Star Trek Generations Enterprise NCC-1701-B/Playma168

Multiple sets of sets and singles cards from various series,
Collectible Card game and non-sport trading cards are included.
Includes 2 chase cards from the TNG series. John de Lancie "Q"
autographed card with CoA and a Skybox exclusive crew card.
Cards are in overall new condition. Some singles may be lesser
grades.

Star Trek Cards Sets and Singles Lot w/Auto and Ch169

Movie adaptation comic. CGC graded comic.
Dragonslayer #1 CGC 9.4 (1981) Marvel170

8 comics. Most are Bronze Age. Highlights include: Doctor Strange
#182 (GD condition) from 1969 features a battle of Doctor Strange
vs. Juggernaut. Captain Marvel is chosen to be the protector of the
universe in Captain Marvel #29 (GD-/GD condition). Iron Man #120
(GD condition) is the first part of the Demon in A Bottle story arc.
This is also the 1st appearance of Justin Hammer. You get all
pictured. Overall VG to FN+/VF-.

Marvel Comics Silver to Bronze Age Comic Lot171

12 figures from various Warp Factor series. Includes the Target
exclusive Seven of Nine! New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Warp Factor Series Figures Lot w/Exclusi172

This vehicle and figure are complete with bombs. Vehicle and
figure appear in overall good shape with light to moderate playwear
and some decal wear. The box appears in nice shape with some
minor shelf wear. Included instruction sheet. The mini comic book
is not included.

M.A.S.K. Thunder Hawk w/Figure and Box 1985/Kenner173

Group of official chase cards from Star Trek trading card sets with
rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth getting
graded! This lot includes: Star Trek Autograph Series A23 Joan
Collins and A25 Majel Barrett.

Lot of 2 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards Joan Co174

Geoff Johns story. Gary Frank cover. CGC graded comic.
Doomsday Clock #11 CGC 9.6 DC Comics175

First appearance of Sersi. CGC graded comic.
Eternals #3 CGC 9.6 1976/1st Sersi176

11 comics. Lot includes Thor: God of Thunder #1 (1st Old King
Thor, NM condition), #20 (1st Old Galactus, NM condition), Thor
(Original series) #338 (2nd appearance and origin of Beta Ray Bill,
VF/VF+ condition), 342,363,386,440 (1st Thor Corps),472, #700
(variant), Astonishing Thor #1, and Thor #1 and 10 from the 2020
series. In issue #1, Thor becomes the Herald of Thunder. Overall
VF to NM condition.

Thor Past to Present Comic Lot/Early Beta Ray Bill177

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #

Jenny Frison variant cover. CGC graded comic.
Department of Truth #1 CGC 9.4/Variant Jenny Friso178

Enterprise 1701-D and Shuttlecraft CD holders from Fun Source
and a Disk Holder from BrainWorks. New in packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG Enterprise + Shuttlecraft CD Holders179

8 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the U.S.S. Enterprise Flight
Display (#8787), Klingon Bird of Prey Flight Display (#6339),
U.S.S. Excelsior (#6630), Original Edition Klingon Cruiser (#6743)
and (4) of the original crew 12" models (Captain Kirk #8773, Mr.
Scott #8777, Mr. Spock #8704, and Doctor McCoy #8774).
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot180

25 copies with 5 sets of each of the cards that were inserted. All of
the polybags are still sealed. Negative Captain America UPC box
variants. Faint creases may be on the covers from the polybag
process. VF+ to NM- condition.

X-Force #1 (x25) with Cards/Marvel181

35 comics. Includes Classic Star War #2(x2),19,Droids #1, Tales of
the Jedi #1 (x5), Dark Empire #1 (x5), #2(x5), #3(x4),#4(x8) and
#6(x4) Star Wars Dark Empire was the first Star Wars comic book
published by Dark Horse. VF+ to NM range.

Star Wars Dark Horse Comics Lot of (35) Dark Empir182

Eight sealed, new in box figures with commemorative silver coins.
Includes a SDCC International Concept Obi-Wan & Yoda which
comes in a protective clam shell case. Overall excellent condition,
but the protective case does have a slight crunch toward the
bottom. See photos for further details and conditions.

Star Wars Saga Legends 30th Anniversary Figures w/183

Variant Stanley Artgerm Lau cover featuring Phoenix. CGC graded
comic.

Demon Days: X-Men #1 CGC 9.8 Artgerm Psylocke Vari184

Ms. Marvel debuts her new costume. Dave Cockrum cover art.
CGC graded comic.

Ms. Marvel #20 CGC 6.5 1978/New Costume185

New in packages. Enesco Klingon Bird-of Prey Figurine and
Starship Enterprise Figurine along with an automated electronic
Borg Bank. The Borg bank was made in 1999, so this will need
new batteries. This is still sealed inside, so we cannot test it and as
such are selling this as is. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Borg Bank + Bird of Prey/Enterprise Figu186

All 4 issues and extra newsstand editions of #1 and #2. VG+/FN-
to FN+/VF- condition.

G.I. Joe and the Transformers #1-4 (1987) w/Extras187

LOT #

Verified autograph by Michael Avon Oeming on the John Cassaday
variant cover. CBCS graded comic.

Red Sonja #1 Variant Signed by Oeming! CBCS 8.5188

132 card and 36 sticker set. Complete! Cards are in overall VG to
Excellent condition. Some single cards/stickers may be higher or
lesser grades.

Battlestar Galactica 1979 Card and Sticker Set189

Stack of 8x10s related to Star Trek, some publicity stills, ad slicks,
and otherwise. As a bonus, this lot includes William Shatner's
autograph on the back of a convention autograph ticket! No CoA,
but Back to the Past believes this signature to be genuine.

Star Trek 8x10 Group "All the Rest" + Shatner Auto190

53 chase cards. Sky Motion, Chromium, Hologram Lenticular and
more from various Star Trek card series. You get all pictured.
Cards appear in overall EX/MT condition. Each one comes in a
protective hard case. Some single cards may have higher or lesser
grades.

Star Trek Trading Card Chase Card Lot191

6 graded cards. Includes card #161 (Stan Lee). Grades are as
follows. Card #161 (Stan Lee) PSA 9, MH1 PSA 7, MH2
PSA6,MH3 PSA8,MH4 PSA7 and MH5 PSA7.

Marvel Universe PSA Graded Holograms + More!192

This lot includes the Menagerie Diorama, the M-113 Creature
Diorama and the Sulu Miniature. Made by Applause.  New
condition in packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Dioramas + Figurine Lot193

#1 (GD condition) is the 1st appearance of Captain Marvel, Captain
Marvel Jr., Mary Marvel, and Doctor Sivana since the Golden Age.
#8 (GD- condition with moisture damage) is a reprint of The Marvel
Family #1 (1945), the first appearance of Black Adam.

Shazam #1 + #8 (1973) 1st Black Adam194

5 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the U.S.S. Enterprise from
TNG (#6619), Klingon Bird of Prey Flight Display (#6339), U.S.S.
Enterprise (#6676), Special edition Galileo II Shuttlecraft ($6006)
and Original Edition Klingon Cruiser (#6743). Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot195

Borg Temple, Enterprise NCC-1701-D, Cardassian Warship and as
well as the Starfleet Away Team, Borg Assimilation Team and
Ferengi Commerce Team. New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Strike Force Figures/Playset/Ships196

1st team appearance of the X-Men Gold (team): Storm, Archangel,
Colossus, Iceman and Jean Grey and 1st team appearance of the
X-Men Blue (team): Cyclops, Wolverine, Gambit, Rogue, Psylocke
and Beast. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #1 (1991) CGC 9.6/Cover A/Jim Lee197
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LOT #

The figure and vehicle appear to have all of the accessories except
for one of the discs. The vehicle is in good shape with light
playwear. The box has the original cardboard insert and has light to
moderate shelf wear. The poster insert is not included. This does
not come with an instruction sheet.

M.A.S.K. Raven w/Figure and Box 1986/Kenner198

This series ran 56 issues with 3 Annuals. It is missing only 8 issues
(#6-10,14,8 and Annual #2). Includes Specials, movie adaptations,
TPBs, promos and more. This lot also includes some duplicate
issues. FN to VF+/NM- condition.

Star Trek (1984 Series) Near Run w/Extras199

5 PC games and other software. All are new in sealed boxes. Star
Trek New Worlds (Interplay), Starfleet Academy Strategic
Command (Interplay), Star Trek Omnipedia (Simon and Schuster),
Star Trek TNG Birth of the Federation (Micro Prose), and Star Trek
Armada (Activision).  Please note that these were originally
purchased in the late 90s, early 2000s, so please check to make
sure that you have the correct PC requirements to use these items.

Star Trek Games and Software Lot200

Two sealed, new in box Star Wars Battle Packs from Episode V.
Includes Jedi Training On Dagobah and Betrayal On Bespin.
Excellent condition. See photos for further details and conditions.

Star Wars Battle Packs Episode V Multi-Figure Set201

Lot includes a Franklin Mint pocket watch, 1979 Board Game
(complete), 1979 Knickerbocker Kirk and Spock plushes (moderate
wear), an assortment of Trek themed TV guides and a collector tin.
The pocket watch is untested, but in excellent condition.

Star Trek Vintage to Modern Collectibles Lot202

Lot includes X-Men #281-282 (1st Trevor Fitzroy and 1st Bishop
Cameo) and 11 copies of X-Men #1 from 1991 with Jim Lee
covers. You get all 5 covers. Includes 2 copies of A-D covers and 3
copies of the gatefold edition cover E. Overall VF+/NM- to NM.

X-Men Key Issue Comic Lot of (13)203

Bronze Age issue #1 with John Buscema cover. CGC graded
comic.

Tarzan #1 (1977/Marvel) CGC 6.5204

Group of official chase cards from Star Trek trading card sets with
rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth getting
graded! This lot includes: Star Trek Autograph Series A6 Robert
Justman, A7 Barbara Anderson, A8 Anthony Call, A9 Robert
Brown, A10 Paul Carr, A11 Kim Darby, A12 Gene Dynarski, A13
Clint Howard, and A14 Bruce Hyde.

Lot of 9 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards205

First appearance and origin of Taskmaster. CGC graded comic.
Avengers #196 CGC 5.0 1st Taskmaster206

LOT #

Includes U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1701 (light and sound working),
U.S.S. Defiant (light working), Mr. Spock and Captain Janeway.
Ornaments are in great shape. Packages have some varied shelf
wear as pictured.

Star Trek Hallmark Ornaments Lot207

All 12 issues of the groundbreaking series by Alan Moore and Dave
Gibbons. Overall FN to VF-, #11 is VG.

Watchmen #1-12 Complete Set (1986) DC208

32-page promotional release with details about the two-month long
event Future State. CGC graded comic.

DC Nation Presents: Future State #1 CGC 9.8209

5 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the U.S.S. Enterprise
NCC-1701-C, Legendary Space Encounter (#8254), Original
Edition Klingon Cruiser (#6743), Special Edition Galileo II
Shuttlecraft (#6006) and Space Ship Set (#6677). Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot210

19 comics. Includes the collected Days of Future Past, as well as
issues
#159,162,213,230,256,257,261,262,280,287,312,314,322,324,326,
327,329 and 333. #213 is the 1st cameo appearance of Mr.
Sinister. Psylocke joins the X-Men in this issue. #256 is the debut
of the classic Psylocke costume. #257 is the 1st appearance of
Psylocke as Lady Mandarin. Overall VF+ to NM, with a few grading
as low as FN-.

X-Men Group of (19) #159-333 w/Days of Future Past211

Lot includes Gold, Silver and Green #1 covers. You get all pictured.
Overall VF/VF+ to NM.

Spider-Man (McFarlane) #1-10/12-14/17 Gold/Silver/212

Cover art by Joseph Michael Linsner. CGC graded comic.
Dawn #1 CGC 9.4 (1995) Joseph Michael Linsner213

This lot includes the Reunion Diorama, and Q and (2) Darmok
miniature figurines. Made by Applause. New condition in packages.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek The Next Generation Dioramas + Figurine214

New in sealed package. This is works, but we suggest replacing
the batteries to restore optimal electronic function. 1994,
Playmates.

Star Trek Generations Klingon Bird-of-Prey/Playmat215

Lot of (10) figures from various Playmates series. You get all
pictured. New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek 9 inch Figure Lot of (10)216

10 comics with lenticular (flicker) covers. You get all pictured. NM
overall.

Marvel Legacy 3-D/Lenticular Cover Variant Lot217

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #

A sealed, new in package Vintage Collection Star Wars: Return of
the Jedi Luke Skywalker (Lightsaber Construction) Deleted Scene
Blu-Ray figure. Overall excellent condition and unpunched. See
photos for further details and conditions.

Star Wars Luke Skywalker (Lightsaber Construction)218

X-Cutioner's Song Part 11. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #16 CGC 9.8/X-Cutioner's Song219

Both are new in sealed packages. Made by Playmates in 1995.
The Phaser still functions and it appears that the batteries in the
Tricorder have died. We suggest opening them to change the
batteries for restoring optimal electronic function.

Star Trek The Next Generation Bajoran Phaser + Tri220

(10) 9 inch figures from various Warp Factor series. Includes KB
Toys exclusive Lt. Marlena Moreau. New in sealed packages.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Warp Factor Series 9 inch Figures Lot w/221

First appearance of Ajax and the Celestials. CGC graded comic.
Eternals #2 CGC 9.0 1976/1st Ajax + Celestials222

The Transporter is new in sealed packaging. The collector case is
in great shape with little wear as pictured.

Star Trek The Next Generation Transporter + Collec223

20 comics. Includes Hulk #16 and 22 (#16 is the 1st full
appearance of the Red She Hulk), Hulk #1 (2011) Long-Beach
Comic-Con exclusive), Hulk #1 (2017), Hulk #1,4,6 (2021, #4 and 6
are variants), She Hulk Vol. 2 #24, Hulk Grand Design Monster #1,
Son of Hulk #1, and original series
#290,305,326,329,333,370,374,377,627 and 635.  #290 is the 1st
and only appearance of Kate Waynesboro as a female version of
M.O.D.O.K. #326 is the battle of Rick Jones as the green Hulk
versus the gray Hulk, Bruce Banner, #333 has cover art by Steve
Geiger with interior art by Todd McFarlane. #377 is the 1st
appearance of the Professor Hulk personality (grey/green
composite) and the 1st appearance of Guilt Hulk, a manifestation
of Banner's guilt. In the VF- to NM range.

Hulk/She-Hulk Past to Present Comic Lot/1st Red Sh224

5 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the Special Edition U.S.S.
Enterprise with Lights and Sounds (#6957), U.S.S. Excelsior
(#6630), U.S.S. Reliant (#8766), Special Edition Galileo II
Shuttlecraft (#6007), and the U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge
(#6007). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot225

This lot contains a group of magazines, a graphic novel, movie
adaptations and more. Highlights include the Aliens official movie
book, Dune storybook, Marvel Super Special #36 (Dune), Star Trek
Debt of Honor, Playboy January 1980 (Steve Martin cover) and
Starlog magazines. VG to FN+/VF- range.

Sci-Fi/Pop Culture Magazines and More Lot226

LOT #

Collector's Edition variant cover art by Joe Quesada. CGC graded
comic.

Batman #500 CGC 9.6 Quesada Variant/Azrael as Batm227

New in sealed packages. Made by Playmates in the 1990s. As this
is sealed, they will need to be opened to install new batteries to
restore functionality.

Star Trek The Next Generation Phaser/Bajoran Trico228

Three sealed, new in box figures. Figures include Emperor
Palpatine and Yoda. Overall great condition. See photos for further
details and conditions.

Star Wars Force Battlers Figure Lot229

20 comics. Various titles. You get all pictured. Strange Tales #150
is the 1st appearance of Umar, Dormammu's sister and the first
artwork at Marvel by John Buscema. GD to VG+ range with rusted
staples and some tears on various comics.

Marvel Silver to Copper Age Comic Book Lot230

The Enterprise with stand that was made in 1993 still works great.
It features lights, the voice of William Shatner and the Star Trek
theme. The Enesco Next Generation starship musical display has
been tested, but we could not get it to work. It is in great shape in
the original box.

U.S.S. Enterprise Figurine/Musical Display Lot231

First appearance of Butterball with Steve Uy cover. CGC graded
comic.

Avengers: The Initiative #13 CGC 9.6/1st Butterbal232

14 figures. This includes a variety of figures of different scales from
different series. All are new in sealed packages. You get all
pictured .Includes the mini-figure retail display.

Star Wars Action Figure Box Lot233

Lot includes: 2 different Original Series 30th Anniversary Metal
card sets (20 card and 6 card) , Star Trek Distinguished Officers
Series (5 metal cards), Star Trek the Next Generation Stardisc
Coins sealed box, and The Making of Star Trek the Next
Generation Skybox Collector 100 card set (sealed).

Star Trek Collector Cards/Sets and More234

Excellent condition. This comes in the original Styrofoam
packaging with COA, but is missing the plastic stand.

Franklin Mint Star Trek USS Defiant NX-74205 Pewte235

Very first issue of the very popular series. CGC graded comic.
What If? #1 CGC 8.0 1977/Spider-Man Joins Fantasti236

First appearance of Powerlord Kruun of the Breakworld. CGC
graded comic.

Astonishing X-Men #19 CGC 9.8/1st Powerlord Kruun237

Group of official chase cards from Star Trek trading card sets with
rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth getting
graded! This lot includes Star Trek Autograph Series A3 Nichelle

Lot of 2 Star Trek Autographed Chase Cards Nichell238
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LOT #
Nichols/Uhura, and A4 George Takei/Sulu.

Lot of (10) figures from various Playmates series. You get all
pictured. New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek 9 inch Figure Lot of (10)239

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:
U.S.S. Enterprise model kit with fiber optic lights (#8772), Klingon
Battle Cruiser (#6812), Cardassian Glaor Class Ship (#8324),
Runabout Rio Grade (#8741), U.S.S. Defiant (#8255) and Security
Officer Odo (#8761). Some of the plastic and cardboard are cut on
the Klingon Battle Cruiser, but the contest are new and unbuilt.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TNG + DS9 Model Kits Lot240

Lot of 20 comics. Highlights include: Silk #1 (2015, NM condition,
the first solo titled series featuring Silk), Amazing Spider-Man #346
(iconic Erik Larsen cover, NM-), Amazing Spider-Man #362 and
363 (2nd and 3rd appearance of Carnage, both NM), Spider-Force
#1 (1st appearance of Spider-Kid and Astro-Spider, NM) and
Spider-Girl #75 (VF+/NM condition, debut of new Spider-Girl
costume). Overall VF+/NM- to NM.

Spider-Man/Spider-Woman/Spider-Girl/Silk + More Lo241

(2) 12" figure giftsets. These were issued in 1996 to celebrate 30
years of Star Trek. New in sealed packages. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Barbie and Ken 12" Doll Giftset (x2)242

15 figures in 6 sets. Lot includes the Target exclusive Kirk/Spock
Interphase set, the 1701 Collector Series, 2 Holodeck and 2 Aliens
series. All are new in sealed packages. Package condition as
pictured.

Star Trek Multi-Figure Pack Lot w/Exclusive243

8 comics. Spawn #1 (NM condition) is the first appearance of
Spawn, Malebolgia, Sam and Twitch and others. Overall VF to NM.

Spawn #1/2/3/4(x2) + Fan Edition #1-3244

28 comics. Includes Batman Last Knight on Earth #1-3, Batman
White Knight #1-8, Batman Three Jokers #1-3 with an extra copy
of #1, Batman #1 (2016), Batman Beyond Rebirth #1, All-Star
Batman (Rebirth) #1 (4 different covers), #2 (2 covers),3,4,5,10 and
14. Overall NM- to NM condition.

Batman White Knight/Last Knight/3 Jokers/Rebirth +245

A modern take on George Orwell's novel, Animal Farm. CGC
graded comic.

Animal Castle #1 CGC 9.6/Ablaze Comics246

Cards #44-55 from the 1966 Fleer Set. All are PSA graded cards.
The breakdown on the cards are (1) PSA 9 card, (2) PSA 8 cards,
and (8) PSA 7 cards.

Three Stooges 1966 Cards #45-55 PSA Graded247

LOT #

Vehicle and figure are complete. Includes instruction sheet and
poster insert. Vehicle has moderate playwear. The box comes with
the original cardboard insert and it appears in nice shape with
minor shelf wear.

M.A.S.K. Jackhammer Vehicle and Figure w/Box 1986/248

20 figures from various Star Trek series from Playmates. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot249

This lot is a short box full of Star Trek comics with sets and many
dupes. Included is over 3 full sets of the original DC limited series
(#1-6), 4 copies of the Beginning TPB, the Modala Imperative
limited series, Ill Wind #2-4, The star Lost TPB, Special #1, The
series Finale, Generations adaptation (regular and square bound),
Riker Special, Shadowheart #1-4, and the complete 4 part
DC/Malibu TNG/DSN crossover. This lot features multiple copies of
most issues listed. Overall VF+ to NM, with a few as low as FN.

Star Trek The Next Generation Comic Lot250

8 vehicle sets with 37 total ships from various series. Includes the
Collector Set III. All are sealed. You get all pictured. Package
condition varies as pictured.

Star Trek Micro Machines Vehicle Sets Lot251

X-Cutioner's Song Part 7. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #15 CGC 9.4/X-Cutioner's Song252

First appearance of Cletus Kasady (becomes Carnage). CGC
graded comic.

Amazing Spider-Man #344 CGC 9.2 Key Carnage253

Three sealed, new in package Target exclusive Star Wars Order 66
figure pairs. Figures include Obi-Wan Kenobi, Anakin Skywalker,
Yoda, and more. Overall excellent condition. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

Star Wars Order 66 Target Exclusive Figure Lot254

6 AMT/Ertl and Monogram sealed model kits. Includes the
Cut-Away U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1701 (#8790), Klingon Crusier
(#8229), U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge (#6007), Deep Space
Nine Space Station (#8778), Voyager Maquis Ship (#3605) and
Voyager Kazon Ship (#3606). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot255

13 figures. New in sealed packages. Includes a few dupes.
Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek TV Series Action Figure Lot256

Variant third printing cover art by Patrick Gleason. CGC graded
comic.

Amazing Spider-Man #55 CGC 9.6/Variant Cover257

18 comics. Lot includes World War Hulk #1-5 set (NM condition. #5
is the 1st cameo appearance of Skaar in the mainstream Marvel
Universe, previously appeared in What If? Featuring Planet Hulk).

Hulk Limited Series Comic Lot/1st Skaar258

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.
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LOT #
This series also includes an additional 2nd print variant for #1, first
and 2nd print Prologue issues, Hulk Gray #1-6 set and Hulk/Thing
Hard Knock #1-4 set. Overall NM- to NM condition.

12 comics. Includes #6,17,20,28,38,41,44,45,49,52 (1 Gold Key
and 1 Whitman edition) and #53. #6 has a great Spock photo
cover! GD/VG to FN/FN+ range.

Star Trek Vintage Gold Key/Whitman Comic Lot259

20 figures. Includes Toyfare exclusives Geordi LaForge and
Captain Calhoun. All are new in sealed packages except for the
First Contact Borg. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot260

11 comics. Lot includes the set of Man of Steel from 1986 with both
covers for #1, Kingdom Come #1 and 2, Crisis on Infinite Earths
#1, and Superman #100 with deluxe cover. VF to NM overall.

DC Major Events Comic Book Lot261

Excellent condition. This comes in the original Styrofoam
packaging with COA.

Franklin Mint Star Trek USS Voyager Pewter Sculptu262

12 figures from various Warp Factor series. Includes the Target
exclusive Lt. Commander Warf and Spencer Gifts Exclusive
Security Officer Neelix! New in sealed packages. Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Warp Factor Series Figures Lot w/Exclusi263

First full appearance of Carnage. CGC graded comic.
Amazing Spider-Man #361 CGC 8.5/1st Carnage264

A variety of German Lord of the Rings Kinder Egg Surprise mini
figures with Gandalf the Grey mini figure.

Lord of the Rings Kinder Egg Surprise Mini Figures265

46 comics. Includes Live of Wolverine #1-5, Deaths of Wolverine
#1-5, Marauders #1-5 and issue #10, Fallen Angels #1-5, Sword
#1-10 (includes extra copy of #1), Way of X #1-5, Inferno #1-4, and
X-Men + Fantastic Four #1-4. Overall NM- to NM condition.

X-Men + Related Modern Era Comic Lot266

First appearance of Carnage cameo. CGC graded comic.
Amazing Spider-Man #360 CGC 9.4/1st Carnage267

Original G1 Transformer. Figure is missing missile launches,
missiles and a fist. Figure appears in overall good shape with some
decal wear as pictured. Box appears complete with
plastic/cardboard insert, but box has heavy wear.

Thrust G1 Transformer w/Box 1985268

Made in 1989 at the time Star Trek V was released. This
Communicator set functions as Walkie talkies with 9-volt batteries
(not included). Model #652.  Tested and working!

Star Trek 1989 Communicator/Walkie Talkies Set269

LOT #

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL. Included are the following:
Special Edition 3-Piece U.S.S. Enterprise Chrome Set (#6005),
Klingon Bird of Prey (#8230), Space Ship Set (#6677), Original
Edition Klingon Crusier (#6743), Doctor Leonard McCoy (#8774)
and Security Chief Odo (#8761). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot270

Group of official chase cards from Star Trek trading card sets with
rare autographs, most of which are sharp NM and worth getting
graded! This lot includes: Deep Space 9 Profiles Armin
Shimerman/Quark, Rene Auberjonois/Odo, and Terry Farrell/Dax
(two of these).

Lot of 4 Star Trek DS9 Autographed Chase Cards271

13 comics. Includes Avengers #684, Immortal Hulk #1, #2DC
(Director's Cut), #17 (2 covers), #20,24,25 (2 covers),27,29,31 and
34. In Avengers #684, it is revealed that Hulk is immortal, some
consider this the first appearance, as the story explains, the Hulk
has always been immortal. Overall NM- to Nm condition.

Immortal Hulk Comic Lot w/1st Immortal Hulk?272

Silver Samurai appearance. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #22 CGC 9.8/Andy Kubert Cover273

First comic book published by Valiant. CGC graded comic.
Super Mario Bros. Special Edition #1 CGC 9.2 1st V274

21 comics. Lot includes Avengers #1-6, Avengers Assemble #1-12
w/Annual #1 and Avengers Tech-On Avengers #1 and 2 (both with
variant covers). Overall VF/VF+ to NM condition.

Avengers (2013)/Avengers Assemble + More Lot275

32-page promotional release with details about the two-month long
event Future State. CGC graded comic.

DC Nation Presents: Future State #1 CGC 9.8276

Lot of (11) figures from various Playmates series. You get all
pictured. New in sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek 9 inch Figure Lot of (11)277

46 comics. Includes Secret Empire #0-10 (includes and extra
variant for #10), Omega #1, FCBD issue, Spotlight, Civil War #1-7
with 2 covers for #1, 3 covers for #2, and 2 covers for #3, Fear
Itself #1-7, War of the Realms #1-6, Onslaught Marvel Universe
#1, Onslaught X-Men #1, Utopia #1,7,8,Conclusion and House of
M sketchbook. Overall NM condition.

Marvel Major Events Comic Book Lot w/Variants278

This lot includes a mix of Sci-Fi, Superheroes and more comic
books. Highlights include Wonder Woman #1 from the 1987 series,
Batman 1989 Special, Batman Returns Movie Adaptation, Total
Recall Movie Special, Buck Rogers comics and more! Overall FN
to VF+/NM-, with a few closer to GD/VG.

Sci-Fi and Superhero Short Box Comic Book Lot279
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LOT #

#1 (VF condition) is the 1st partial team appearance and origin of
The Eternals and The Deviants. 1st appearance of Ikaris, Kro,
Brother Tode and Margo Damian. #3 (VF condition) is the 1st
appearance of Sersi. The rest contain many other first appearances
and/or notable events. Overall VF to VF+/NM- condition.

The Eternals #1/3/5/6/10/11280

Psylocke appearance. CGC graded comic.
X-Men #20 CGC 9.8/Psylocke Appearance281

Vehicle and figures appear complete. This has been tested and
does work, but the batteries were corroded inside of the vehicle
before being tested. We cleaned out the compartment before
testing. This does not come with a poster insert or instruction
sheet. The box has the original cardboard insert. The box appears
in overall good shape with some moderate shelf wear.

M.A.S.K. Volcano Vehicle and Figures w/Box 1986/Ke282

This lot includes 6 KB Toys exclusive 9 inch figures. Kirk, Spock,
McCoy, Uhura, Sulu and Moreau. New in sealed packages.

Star Trek Original Series Exclusive 9 inch Figures283

Marvel Super-Heroes #12 (GD- condition) is the 1st appearance
and origin of Captain Marvel. #1 (GD- condition) is the 2nd
appearance of Carol Danvers and the 3rd appearance, the Captain
Marvel and the 2nd appearance of Ronan the Accuser. Overall GD
condition.

Marvel Super-Heroes #12 + Captain Marvel #1/2/7/10284

6 sealed model kits from AMT/ERTL and Polar Lights. Included are
the following:  Cut-Away U.S.S. Enterprise NCC-1801 (#8790),
U.S.S. Enterprise B from Generations (8762), Legendary Space
Encounter (#8254)U.S.S. Enterprise (#6676), First Officer Mr.
Spock (#8704) and Klingon D7 Battlecruiser (#4202). Package
condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot285

1st team appearance of the X-Men Gold (team): Storm, Archangel,
Colossus, Iceman and Jean Grey and 1st team appearance of the
X-Men Blue (team): Cyclops, Wolverine, Gambit, Rogue, Psylocke
and Beast. CGC graded comic.

X-Men #1 (1991) CGC 9.6/Cover C/Jim Lee286

First appearance of the Eternals and Deviants. Includes origin.
CGC graded comic.

Eternals #1 CGC 8.5 1976/1st Eternals + Origin287

Star Trek Autograph Series card A17: Ricardo Montalban as Khan.
Sharp NM condition.

Star Trek Autograph Series: Ricardo Montalban288

Includes 2 copies of #1 (both reprints, GD condition with moisture
damage), #5,33,35 (1st meeting of Darth Vader and Luke
Skywalker), #36,101,and 3 copies each of Return of the Jedi #1
and 2 (2 copies of each are in sealed polybags).  Overall VG to

Star Wars Vintage Marvel Comics Lot289

LOT #
VF+ range.

A shot box of comics from Marvel, DC and more. Most of the
comics are Copper to Modern age. Highlights include 2 copies of
Guardians of the Galaxy #1 from 1990 (newsstand and regular
edition), Pokemon #1 (13th print), Silver Surfer #1 (1987), Amazing
Spider-Man #328 (final artwork in the Amazing Spider-Man title by
Todd McFarlane), X-Men and the Micronauts #1-4, Buckaroo
Banzai movie Adaptation #1-2, the Justice League #11 Aquaman
movie variant cover and more. Overall VF to NM, with a few as low
as VG/Fn.

Marvel/DC and More Collectible Comics Box Lot290

5 PC games and other software. All are new in sealed boxes. Star
Trek Klingon Academy (Interplay), Star Trek Klingon Honor Guard
(Interplay), Star Trek Klingon (Simon and Schuster), Star Trek TNG
A Final Unity (Spectrum Holobyte), and Star Trek Borg the Ultimate
Interactive Movie (Simon and Schuster).  Please note that these
were originally purchased in the late 90s, early 2000s, so please
check to make sure that you have the correct PC requirements to
use these items.

Star Trek Games and Software Lot291

Lucio Parrillo variant cover. CGC graded comic.
Vampirella #10 CGC 9.6 Indiegogo Virgin Sketch Var292

Cards #44-55 from the 1966 Fleer Set. All are PSA graded cards.
The breakdown on the cards are (1) PSA 9 card, (2) PSA 8 cards,
and (8) PSA 7 cards.

Three Stooges 1966 Cards #45-55 PSA Graded293

Rhino and figures are complete with missile. Includes mini-comic
#2, poster insert and instruction sheet as well as an Alex Sector
and Scott Trakker figure with some accessories from other
adventure packs. The box comes with the original cardboard insert.
The vehicle appears in overall good shape with some light
playwear. Box is in overall good shape with moderate shelf wear.

M.A.S.K. Rhino Vehicle w/Figures and More 1985/Ken294

16 figures. Includes 12" Janeway and Benjamin Sisko, (4) 7 inch
scale figures from Nemesis, a 7 inch scale Nausicaan Captain from
Enterprise, a Toyfare exclusive Captain Calhoun and more! New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Action Figure Lot295

2 long boxes of comics. This lot features the near run. It has every
issue except #26 and 79 and includes all of the Annuals (#1-6).
Almost every issue listed has more than one copy included. Overall
VF+ to NM with some grading as low as FN.

Star Trek The Next Generation DC Near Run w/Extras296

Lot includes the Classic Star Trek Bridge Crew figure set of 7 as
well as 2 Art Asylum and one Toys R Us exclusive figure. New in
sealed packages. Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Original Series Action Figure + Diorama297
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LOT #

Lot includes Innerspace mini playsets, Headliners, die-cast and
plastic figurines and more. You get all pictured. A few of the items
do not have packages. Package conditions as pictured.

Star Trek Collectibles/Toy Lot298

Included is the full set of cards and stickers from E.T. (1982),
Terminator 2 Stickers full box with 48 sealed packs, a sealed box of
Stargate trading cards, Species 90 card set, V 66 card base set (no
stickers) and Dune cards 1-100. Overall excellent condition or
better.

Sci-Fi Non-Sports Trading Card Lot Vintage to Mode299

5 AMT/Ertl sealed model kits. Includes the Special Edition U.S.S.
Enterprise with Lights and Sounds (#6957), U.S.S. Excelsior
(#6630), U.S.S. Reliant (#8766), Special Edition Galileo II
Shuttlecraft (#6007), and the U.S.S. Enterprise Command Bridge
(#6007). Package condition as pictured.

Star Trek Starships and More Model Kit Lot300

Star Trek Autograph Series card A1: William Shatner as Captain
Kirk. Sharp NM condition.

Star Trek Autograph Series: William Shatner301
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