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LOT # QTY

1Auction Policies1

A complete vintage 1958 Hubley Colt 45 toy cap gun, with six
bullets and original packaging. Cap gun measures roughly 13" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the
cap gun is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches
are present. Packaging appears to be in overall nice condition, but
does exhibit storage wear as present through foxing, scuffing,
taped corners, and creasing. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Colt 45 Cap Gun W/ Original Box2

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Mark II toy cap gun in a silver finish
with pearl grips and bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12
3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger are non
functioning and grip has a small break. Bullets no longer smoke.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 MII Cap Gun3

A vintage cast iron Stevens Scout toy cap gun in a golden finish
with patented date of June 17, 1890. Cap gun measures roughly 7"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition however, an aged patina
and light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Gold Scout Cap Gun4

A pair of two vintage JOAL Revolver 42 cap guns in a silver finish
with red grips. Cap guns measure approximately 7" from tip to grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage JOAL Revolver 42 Cap Gun Lot (2)5
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Two vintage circa 1940s Kilgore Captain cap guns. Items measure
roughly 4 3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger  on both
items function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual condition,
however, an aged patina and surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11940s Kilgore Captain Cap Gun Lot of (2)6

A vintage Daisy Powerline 44 Revolver from the 1980's. Revolver
measures approximately 11 1/4" from tip to grip.  The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however, light surface scratches and paint wear are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage Daisy Powerline 44 Revolver BB Gun7

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley cap guns, which includes a Texan
and a Texan Jr cap gun. The Texan measures roughly 9 1/4" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function.
Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual condition, however, an
aged patina and surface scratching are present on both metal
portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)8

A collection of five vintage toy guns including two wooden Texas
Jr.'s and an Army 45 as well as two rubber pistols. Texan Jr.'s
measure 6 3/4" in length for reference. Toy guns are used and in
visually good condition with visible signs paint wear and playwear.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Toy Gun Lot (5)9

A vintage wooden Tom Mix toy gun circa 1930s. Item measures
roughly 8" from barrel to grip. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, storage wear such as surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Tom Mix Wooden Cap Gun10
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A pair of two Italian made cap guns including a 1960's Mondial
Starter Pistol. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Guns
measure approximately 5 1/4" in length. Toy guns are used and in
visually good condition with visible signs paint wear and playwear.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Italian Cap Gun Lot (2)11

A variety of toy ammunition to be paired with Hubley cap guns.
Conditions vary. You get all pictured.

1Hubley Cap Gun Ammunition Lot12

A pair of two vintage Halco Hubley Pistol cap guns from the 1960's.
Cap guns come with silver finish and tan grips. Cap guns measure
approximately 8" from tip to grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, metal wear and surface scratches are present. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Halco Hubley Pinto Pistol Cap Gun (2)13

Two vintage Kilgore cap guns, which includes both a Border Patrol
and Hawkeye . Largest item measures roughly 4 1/2" from barrel to
grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function. Overall, both
cap guns are in nice visual condition, however, storage wear such
as surface scratching and an aged patina are present on both
items. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Cap Gun Lot of (2)14

A vintage Kilgore "Grizzly" cap gun from the 1950's that comes with
original box. Cap gun measures approximately 9 3/4" from tip to
end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light surface
scratches are present. Box is in good condition with some signs of
wear including a tear along the corner of both bottom box and
cover. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions...

11950's Kilgore Grizzly Cap Gun W/ Box15

A vintage circa 1930s cast iron Mordt toy cap & dart gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
no longer appear to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Mordt Cap & Dart Gun16

A vintage 1930's Gene Autry cap gun by Kenton that comes with a
Gene Autry holster. Cap gun measures approximately 6 1/4" from
tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition and includes a

11930's Gene Autry Cap Gun With Holster17

LOT # QTY
rhinestone detail piece; however,  light surface scratches are
present. Holster is in decent condition with signs of wear including
cracks and creases to the leather as well as heavy scratching to
the rhinestones. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

A vintage 1935 Buck Rogers Disintegrator XZ-38 toy gun produced
by Daisy. Item measures roughly 10 1/4" from barrel to grip. This
item no longer sparks when the trigger is pulled Overall, the cap
gun is in nice visual condition however, storage wear such as
surface scratching and patina is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Buck Rogers Disintegrator XZ-38 Toy Gun18

A vintage Crosman Model No. 1377 BB gun from the 1970's. BB
Gun measures approximately 13 1/2" from tip to end of grip.  The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, light surface scratches are present.
See pictures for further   details and conditions.

11970's Crosman Model No. 1377 BB Gun19

Two vintage Hubley Champ cap guns. Items measure roughly 4
3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items
function, however, it appears that the cap compartments have
buildup and are difficult to open. Overall, both cap guns are in nice
visual condition, however, an aged patina and storage wear such
as surface scratching are present on both metal portions and grips.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Champ Cap Gun Lot of (2)20

A vintage Johnny Eagle "Lieutenant" cap gun from 1965 that
comes with original case and accessories. Cap gun measures
approximately 8 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. Case
measures 10 1/4"x 6 1/4" and is in okay condition with signs of
wear including scratching, cracking, and discoloration. Lot includes
all six bullets and magazine. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11965 Johnny Eagle Lieutenant Pistol Cap Gun + Case21

A vintage cast iron Stevens "Safety 50 Shot" toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Safety 50 Shot Toy Cap Gun22
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A pair of two Crosman Spud Guns from the 1950's. Spud guns
measure approximately 6 1/8" from tip to grip. Spring trigger
appears to be functioning. Overall, the spud guns are in good
visual condition with wear including surface scratches and patina.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Crosman Spud Gun (2)23

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley cap guns, which includes a Texan
and a Texan Jr cap gun. The Texan measures roughly 9 1/4" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function.
Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual condition, however, an
aged patina and surface scratching are present on both metal
portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)24

A pair of two Schmidt Buck N' Bronco cap guns from the 1950's.
Cap guns measure approximately 10" from tip to grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition with some wear including surface scratches. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11950's Schmidt Buck N' Bronco Cap Gun (2)25

A vintage circa 1960s Halco Texas Ranger toy cap gun with
holster. Cap gun measures roughly 8 1/2" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger seems to function. The holster is unmarked
and may not necessarily match the cap gun. Overall, the cap gun is
in nice visual condition however, an aged patina, build-up in the
cap compartment, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11960s Halco Texas Ranger Cap Gun & Holster Lot26

A pair of two gold "Smoky"  mini pistol cap guns with holsters. Cap
guns measure approximately 5 1/2" from tip to grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition with some wear including surface scratches.
Holsters are in great visual condition as well with some signs of
playwear and measure 6 1/4". All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1"Smoky" Gold Mini Pistols With Holsters (2)27

Two vintage cast iron Stevens single shot Echo & Zip cap guns
from various years. The largest item measures roughly 5" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function.
Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual condition, however, an
aged patina and storage wear such as surface scratching are

1Vintage Stevens Echo & Zip Cap Gun Lot of (2)28
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present on both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A vintage Johnny Eagle "Red River" cap gun from the 1960's that
comes with bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12 1/2" from
tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present and one screw is missing, thus
making the grip loose. Lot includes all six bullets. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Johnny Eagle Red River Pistol Cap Gun29

A vintage circa 1950s Dodge Melton "The Plainsman" toy cap gun.
Cap gun measures roughly 10 1/2" from barrel to grip. The
hammer, trigger, and cylinders all seem to function. Overall, the
cap gun is in good visual condition however, an aged patina and
storage wear such as light surface scratching are present on both
gun and grip. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Dodge Melton The Plainsman Toy Cap Gun30

A pair of two vintage "Pony" pistol cap guns by Esquire-Actoy from
the 1950's-1960's. Cap guns measure approximately 6 3/4" from tip
to grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the
cap guns are in great visual condition with some wear including
surface scratches. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Esquire-Actoy "Pony" Cap Gun (2)31

Two vintage circa 1960s Hubley single shot Pet cap guns. Both
items measure roughly 6" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger on both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, storage wear such as surface scratching
are present on both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11960s Hubley Pet Cap Gun Lot of (2)32

A vintage Lasso Em' Bill holster set box from the 1940's-1950's and
an unmarked holster set. Lasso Em' Bill box is in good visual
condition with some signs of age and wear including surface
abrasion of one flap. Box measures 9 3/4"x6 1/4". Holster set is
unmarked but in decent condition with visible wear including
scratches and discoloration to the leather. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Lasso Em' Bill Box and Holster Set33

We are always buying and looking for high quality consignments! Call 313-533-3130 with your collection.

http://www.proxibid.com/backtothepast!


8/5 Wild West: Vintage BB & Cap Guns Pt 1  8/5/2022

Page: 4

Get the full catalog with photos, prebid and join us live at www.proxibid.com/backtothepast! See site for full terms.

Back to the Past Collectibles

LOT # QTY

A variety of toy ammunition to be paired with Hubley cap guns.
Conditions vary. You get all pictured.

1Hubley Cap Gun Ammunition Lot34

A vintage Uniwerk Volcanic 22 cap gun in a silver finish from the
1960's. Cap gun measures approximately 5" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches and
discoloration are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

11960's Uniwerk Volcanic 22 Cap Gun35

A vintage cast iron Stevens "Eagle" single shot toy cap gun with
patented date of June 17, 1890. Cap gun measures roughly 4 1/4"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition however, an aged
patina and storage wear such as light surface scratching are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Eagle Toy Cap Gun36

A vintage Stevens Peacemaker cap gun in a gold finish from the
1940's. Cap gun measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11940's Stevens Gold Peacemaker Cap Gun37

Two vintage Hubley single shot cap guns, featuring a 1938 Teddy
and circa 1950s Bull. The Teddy cap gun measures roughly 5 1/2"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function.
Overall, both cap guns are in good visual condition, however, slight
patina and storage wear such as surface scratching are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Pet Cap Gun Lot of (2)38

A pair of two 1950's Hubley Texan cap gun. Cap gun measures
roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on
both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual
condition, however, surface scratches are present on both metal
portions and grips. The holster is unmarked and may not
necessarily match the cap gun. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot39

A vintage circa 1950s Kilgore Roy Rogers Shoot'n Iron cap gun
with box. Cap gun measures roughly 10" from barrel to grip. The
hammer, trigger, and cylinder all seem to function. Overall, the cap

11950s Roy Rogers Shoot'n Iron Cap Gun W/ Box Lot40
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gun is in nice visual condition however, an aged patina and storage
wear such as light surface scratching are present. Box does not
seem to match this specific make of cap gun. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A Daisy No. 499 air rifle. Rifle measures approximately 36" from tip
to end of butt. The pump is air tight and hammer and trigger are
both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches and paint wear are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

1Daisy No. 499 Air Pump Gun41

A vintage Italian Precise Vanguard toy cap gun. Cap gun measures
roughly 5 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer, trigger, and
cylinders all seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition, however, storage wear such as light surface scratching
are present on both gun and grip. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Precise Vanguard Pistol Toy Cap Gun42

A pair of two vintage "S-Agent" pistol cap guns by Crescent Toys
from the 1960's. Cap guns measure approximately 6" from barrel
tip to grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall,
the cap guns are in good visual condition with some wear including
surface scratches and metal erosion in some area. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11960's "S-Agent" Crescent Toys Cap Gun (2)43

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, an aged patina and surface scratching are
present on both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)44

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)45

A circa 1950s Stevens Big Scout cap gun. Item measures roughly 7
1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however, rusting,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching are
present on both gun and grip. Additionally, the right side grip has a

11950s Stevens Big Scout Cap Gun46
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break present on the bottom. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

A collection of two Esquire-Actoy cap guns that include "Special"
and "Pony Boy"  pistol cap guns from the 1950's-1960's. The
"Special" cap guns measures approximately 10 3/4" from barrel tip
to grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning on Pony Boy,
but hammer does not function on Special. Overall, the cap guns
are in great visual condition with some wear including surface
scratches. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage Esquire-Actoy Cap Gun Lot (2)47

Two vintage Kilgore cast iron Six Shooter cap guns. Both items
measure roughly 6 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
on both items seem to function, however, the Automatic six shooter
does not seem to shoot. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, patina and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Six Shooter Cap Gun Lot of (2)48

A vintage 1950's Buck N' Bronco Pathfinder by George Schmidt.
Cap gun has a chrome finish and measures approximately 11 1/2"
from barrel tip to end of grip. Cap gun includes a hidden compass
on the bottom of the grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

1Vintage Schmidt BuckN'Bronco Pathfinder W/ Compass49

A vintage Hubley Flintlock cap gun. Item measures roughly 9 1/4"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however, build-up,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Flintlock Toy Cap Gun50

A vintage 1930's Lone Eagle by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 5" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning albeit slow to move. Overall, the cap
gun is in okay visual condition with surface scratches and metal
wear.  All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions..

11930's Kilgore Lone Eagle Cap Gun51

A vintage National No. 380 cap gun. Item measures roughly 7"
from barrel to grip. The trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap
gun is in good visual condition, however, patina, and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have

11930s National No. 380 Toy Cap Gun52
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been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

An in box die cast Beretta M93R by Dong San. Model gun
measures approximately 4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
trigger appears to be functioning. Box includes all pieces. Overall,
gun is in great visual condition with light surface scratches from
years of storage. Box is in good condition with some storage wear
around flaps and measures 6 3/4"x 4". Please All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

1Complete Dong San Die Cast Beretta M93R W/ Box53

A vintage Gambler Mini Derringer die-cast cap pistol. Item
measures roughly 3" from barrel to grip. This item is brand new,
never opened, and still on the original card. Overall, the packaging
is in good condition, however, storage wear is present through
scuffing and slight breaks in the bubble. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Gambler Mini Derringer Die-Cast Cap Pistol54

A vintage Daisy No. 118 Targeteer Pellet Gun circa 1930's-1940's.
Gun  measures approximately 10 1/2" from barrel tip to end of butt.
The pump is air tight and  trigger is functioning. Overall, the pump
gun is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

1Daisy No. 118 Targeteer Air Pump Gun55

A vintage Leslie-Henry cap gun. Item measures roughly 9 1/4" from
barrel to grip. The trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is
in good visual condition, however, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Leslie-Henry Maverick Toy Cap Gun56

A pair of two Schmidt Buck N' Bronco cap guns from the 1950's.
Cap guns include a BB-Marshall and BB-Cowhand and measure
approximately 10" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger
are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great visual
condition with some wear including surface scratches and paint
wear. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11950's Schmidt Buck N' Bronco Cap Gun (2)57

A vintage circa 1960s Daisy No. 177 cap gun. Item measures
roughly 10 3/8" from barrel to grip. The trigger seem to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however, patina,
and storage wear such as light surface scratching are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for

11960s Daisy No. 177 Toy Cap Gun58
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further details and conditions.

A collection of five Mini Derringer cap guns from makers such as
Halco, Hubley, Nichols, and more. Nichols derringer measures 3
1/2" inches and is the largest cap gun for reference. Hammers and
triggers vary in functionality. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition with some wear including surface scratches and
paint wear. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Mini Derringer Cap Gun Lot (5)59

Three antique circa 1920s Kilgore cast iron Invincible cap guns. All
items measure roughly 5 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger on all items seem to function. Overall, all three cap guns are
in nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear
such as surface scratching are present. Additionally, one of the
items has a broken trigger guard. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Antique Kilgore Invincible Cap Gun Lot of (3)60

A collection of three retro toy guns including a plastic 007 luxe
pistol which measures 12" for reference. Toy guns are used and in
visually good condition with visible signs paint wear and playwear.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Retro Toy Gun Lot (3)61

A circa 1930s cast iron Hubley Yanki Boy single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 10 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11930s Hubley Yanki Boy Toy Cap Gun62

A collection of two Italian made Edison Giocattoli cap guns from
the 1970's. Cap Guns include a Susanna pistol and a Texas Kid.
Susanna measures approximately 8 1/2" from tip to end of grip.
The hammers and triggers are both functioning. Overall, the cap
guns are in great visual condition however, light surface scratches
are present and more so on the Texas Kid. Please All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions..

11970's Edison Giocattoli Cap Gun Lot (2)63

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in great visual
condition, however, an aged patina and surface scratching are
present on both metal portions and grips. The hammer on the bull
grip cap gun is slightly loose to fire. All cap guns have been

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)64
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presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish with
white grips, bullets, and holster. Cap gun measures approximately
12 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Bullets no longer smoke. Holster is unmarked/branded
and measures 11" in length. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. Holster
shows some light signs of wear including stress to the leather.
Please All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun With Holster65

A vintage Actoy 250 Shot cap gun.  Item measures roughly 9 3/4"
from barrel to grip. The trigger, hammer, and cylinder seems to
function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition,
however, patina, build-up, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Actoy 250 Shot Toy Cap Gun66

A vintage Johnny Eagle "Magumba" cap gun from 1965 that comes
with original case, accessories and instructions. Cap gun measures
approximately 10 1/2" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. Case
measures 11 1/4"x 5 1/2" and is in okay condition with signs of
wear including scratching and discoloration. Lot includes all six
bullets and magazine. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11965's Johnny Magumba Pistol Cap Gun + Case67

A circa 1940s cast iron Hubley Army 45 toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 6 3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. Additionally, the left grip is slightly
loose. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

11940s Hubley Army 45 Toy Cap Gun68

A vintage 1950's Spitfire Pistol cap gun by Actoy. Cap gun has a
bronze finish and measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel tip to
end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light surface
scratches and small amounts of discoloration are present.  All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

11950's Actoy Bronze Spitfire Cap Gun69
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A vintage circa 1950s Hubley Hawk toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 5 1/2" from barrel to grip. The trigger seems to function but
the hammer appears to no longer click. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, cap compartment
build-up, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1950s Hubley Hawk Toy Cap Gun70

A vintage Nichols Stallion 41-40 cap gun in a silver finish with
marled grips that comes in its original box with bullets. Cap gun
measures approximately 10" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Bullets no longer smoke. Box
measures 11 1/4"x5 1/2" and is in good condition, but does show
signs of wear including creasing from the "gun rack" display.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 41-40 Cap Gun W/ Box71

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)72

A vintage 1958 Hubley Colt 45 toy cap gun, with six bullets. Cap
gun measures roughly 13" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
conditional however, light surface scratches are present. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

1Vintage Hubley Colt 45 Cap Gun73

A circa 1950s Actoy Wells Fargo toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to
function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however,
patina, play wear, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950s Actoy Wells Fargo Toy Cap Gun74

A collection of two Esquire-Actoy cap guns that include "Special"
and "Pony Boy"  pistol cap guns from the 1950's-1960's. The
"Special" cap guns measures approximately 10 3/4" from barrel tip
to grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning on Pony Boy,
but hammer does not function on Special. Overall, the cap guns
are in great visual condition with some wear including surface
scratches. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details

1Vintage Esquire-Actoy Cap Gun Lot (2)75

LOT # QTY
and conditions.

Two vintage Kilgore cast iron Six Shooter cap guns. Both items
measure roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on
both items seem to function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice
visual condition, however, patina and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. Additionally, one of the cap gun's
compartment seems to be rusted closed. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Six Shooter Cap Gun Lot of (2)76

A collection of three mini pistol cap guns from makers such as
Halco, Nichols, and more. Halco pistol measures 3 3/4" inches and
is the largest cap gun for reference. Hammers and triggers vary in
functionality. Overall, the cap guns are in great visual condition with
some wear including surface scratches and paint wear. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Mini Pistol Cap Gun Lot (3)77

A vintage Leslie-Henry cap gun. Item measures roughly 10 3/4"
from barrel to grip. The trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap
gun is in good visual condition, however, patina, and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Leslie-Henry Maverick Toy Cap Gun78

A vintage 1950's Red Ranger by Wyandotte. Cap gun has a gold
finish with marbled grips. Cap gun measures approximately 8" from
barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11950's Wyandotte Gold Red Ranger Cap Gun79

A circa 1940s cast iron Hubley Army 45 toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 6 3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. Additionally, the left grip is slightly
loose. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

11940s Hubley Army 45 Toy Cap Gun80

A complete vintage 1958 "Fanner 50" cap gun by Mattel that
comes with original box, bullets and instructions. Cap gun
measures approximately 10 1/2" from tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
great visual condition however, light surface scratches and paint

11958 Mattel Fanner-50 Cap Gun W/ Box81
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wear are present. Box is in great condition aside from some tape
wear along the bottom side of the box. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions...

A vintage circa 1940s Kilgore American toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 10" from barrel to grip. The trigger, hammer, and
cylinder seems to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1940s Kilgore American Toy Cap Gun82

A vintage 1950's Thundergun with silver finish by Marx. Cap gun
measures approximately 12" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, light surface scratches are present
and the silver finish has started to wear.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11950's Marx Thundergun Cap Gun83

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan and Texan Jr. cap guns.
The Texan Jr. measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer
and trigger on both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in
great visual condition, however, rusting, an aged patina, and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. The hammer on the bull grip cap gun
is slightly loose to fire. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)84

A vintage 1950's Roy Rogers pistol with silver finish by Classy. Cap
gun measures approximately 10" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
trigger functions well, however the hammer does not click. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light surface
scratches are present.  All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Classy Roy Rogers Cap Gun85

A vintage Cossman No. 504 Spud Gun with the original box. Item
measures roughly 6" from barrel to grip. The trigger does appear to
work, but does take a bit of effort to pull. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition, however, patina and storage wear such as
light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Cossman No. 504 Spud Gun W/ Box86

A pair of two 1950's Hubley Texan Jr cap gun. Cap gun measures
roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on
both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual
condition, however, surface scratches are present on both metal

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot (2)87

LOT # QTY
portions and grips. The holster is unmarked and may not
necessarily match the cap gun but appears in good visual condition
with some leather wear including staining and creasing. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A vintage National No. 380 cast iron toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 7 1/4" from barrel to grip. The trigger and hammer seems
to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage National No. 380 Cast Iron Cap Gun88

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish that
comes in box with six bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12
3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Bullets no longer smoke. Overall, the cap gun is in
great visual condition however, light surface scratches are present
and there is small amounts of discoloration to the grip. Box
measures 12"x5" and is in good condition with signs of wear and
storage, including creasing and discoloration. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun W/ Box89

An antique circa 1920s Stevens "Bull" single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 4 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Antique 1920s Stevens "Bull" Toy Cap Gun90

A vintage 1960's Maverick by Leslie-Henry. Cap gun has a silver
finish with bronze grips. Cap gun measures approximately 9 1/2"
from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Leslie-Henry Maverick Cap Gun91

A circa 1940s Stevens The Sheriff single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 4 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11940s Stevens The Sheriff Toy Cap Gun92
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A 1950's Hubley Texan Jr cap gun with a Wild Bill Hickok holster.
Cap gun measures roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The
hammer and trigger both function. Overall, cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, surface scratches are present on both metal
portions and grips. The holster is not brand specific other than Wild
Bill Hickok and may not necessarily match the cap gun but appears
in good visual condition with some leather wear including staining
and creasing and missing accessories. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot93

Two vintage Hubley "Western" toy cap guns. Items measure
roughly 9" from barrel to grip. The triggers and hammers seem to
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual
condition, however, cap compartment build-up, patina, and storage
wear such as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Western Toy Cap Gun Lot of (2)94

A vintage 1950's Wyatt Earp pistol with silver finish by Actoy. Cap
gun measures approximately 9 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning although the trigger
guard is missing. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present as well as
discoloration to the plastic grips.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11950's Actoy Wyatt Earp Cap Gun95

Two vintage Hubley and Halco toy cap guns. Items measure about
9 1/4" from barrel to grip. The triggers and hammers seem to
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual
condition, however, cap compartment build-up, patina, and storage
wear such as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley/Halco Toy Cap Gun Lot of (2)96

A vintage 1940's Secret Agent Hideaway Pistol/Derringer cap gun
by Hamilton that comes with original box. Cap gun measures
approximately 5 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, surface scratches are present to both metal and
plastic parts. Box is in okay to good condition with signs of wear
including missing box flaps and creasing down the sides. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions...

11940s Hamilton Secret Agent Hideaway Pistol W/ Box97

LOT # QTY

Two vintage Hubley "Cowboy" toy cap guns. Items measure
roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The triggers and hammers seem to
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, cap compartment build-up, patina, and storage
wear such as light surface scratching is present. Additionally, the
grips on one gun are slightly loose. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Cowboy Toy Cap Gun Lot of (2)98

A 1950's Hubley Texan Jr cap gun with a holster. Cap gun
measures roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and
trigger both function, however, a piece of the hammer is broken.
Overall, cap gun is in nice visual condition, however, surface
scratches are present on both metal portions and grips. The holster
is not brand specific and may not necessarily match the cap gun
but appears in good visual condition with some leather wear
including staining and creasing. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot99

A vintage circa 1950s Hubley/Halco Texan holster with matching
Texan gun. Cap gun measures roughly 9 1/2" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger seems to function. Overall, the cap gun is
in nice visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. The holster itself is
also in nice overall condition, but does show signs of play wear. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

11950s Hubley/Halco Texan Holster Set W/ Box100

A Daisy No. 799 Ted Williams air rifle from the 1970's. Rifle has a
gold and wooden finish. Rifle measures approximately 38" from tip
to end of butt. The pump is air tight and hammer and trigger are
both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in good visual condition
however, light surface scratches and paint wear are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

1Daisy "Ted Williams" Air Pump Gun101

A circa 1930s cast iron Hubley Yanki Boy single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 10 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear
such as light surface scratching is present. Additionally, there is a
light crack present on the left side of the barrel. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930s Hubley Yanki Boy Toy Cap Gun102
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A vintage 1950's Roy Rogers cap gun by Schmidt. Cap gun
measures approximately 9 1/2" from tip to grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition with some wear including surface scratches. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Schmidt Roy Rogers Cap Gun103

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns with an extra
pair of teal grips. The Texan Jr. measures roughly 8 1/4" from
barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on both items function properly.
Overall, both cap guns are in great visual condition, however, slight
rusting, an aged patina and other signs of storage wear such as
surface scratching are present on both metal portions and grips.
The hammer on the bull grip cap gun is slightly loose to fire. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)104

A circa 1940s cast iron Hubley Army 45 toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 6 3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11940s Hubley Army 45 Toy Cap Gun105

A vintage circa 1950s Kilgore Roy Rogers toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 9" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition
however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1950s Kilgore Roy Rogers Cap Gun106

A pair of vintage 1930's Gene Autry cap guns by Kenton. Guns
come in both a light and dark finish with varied grips. Cap guns
measures approximately 6 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition, however, light surface scratches are present on
both gun and grip as well as some wear and rust to the metal. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930's Gene Autry Cap Gun (2)107

A 1925 National cast iron toy cap gun. Cap gun measures about 6"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems to function
properly. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition however,
an aged patina, rusting, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11925 National Cast Iron Toy Cap Gun108

LOT # QTY

A circa 1960's Wyatt Earp cap gun by Hubley that comes with a
Wyatt Earp holster. Cap gun measures approximately 10 3/4" from
tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition, however,  light
surface scratches are present. Holster is in decent condition with
signs of wear including cracks and creases to the leather. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11960's Hubley Wyatt Earp Cap Gun & Holster Lot109

A vintage circa 1940s Kilgore Lone Ranger toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition
however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1940s Kilgore Lone Ranger Cap Gun110

A circa 1960's 250 Shot Scout Rifle by Hubley. Rifle measures
approximately 33" from tip to end of butt. The hammer and trigger
are both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches and paint wear are
present as well as plastic discoloration. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Hubley Scout Rifle111

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)112

A vintage 1950's Rin Tin Tin Pistol cap gun by Actoy. Cap gun has
a bronze finish and measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel tip
to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches and small amounts of discoloration are present.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11950's Actoy Bronze Rin Tin Tin Cap Gun113

A vintage Kenton "Blank Shooter" single shot toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 6" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Blank Shooter Cast Iron Cap Gun114
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A vintage 1950's  Hopalong Cassidy by Wyandotte. Cap gun has a
gold finish with black and gold grips that feature a likeness of
Hopalong Cassidy. Cap gun measures approximately 8 1/2" from
barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11950's Wyandotte Gold Hopalong Cassidy Cap Gun115

A vintage circa 1930s Kenton Lasso 'Em Bill single shot toy cap
gun with one round of ammunition. Cap gun measures about 9"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition with all jewels
existing on the grip, however, an aged patina and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930s Kenton Lasso 'Em Bill Cap Gun116

A variety of toy ammunition to be paired with Nichols and Hubley
cap guns. Conditions vary. You get all pictured.

1Nichols/Hubley Cap Gun Ammunition Lot117

A vintage circa 1930s cast iron Mordt toy cap & dart gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
no longer appears to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Mordt Cap & Dart Gun118

A vintage 1960's Wild Bill Hickok cap gun by Leslie-Henry. Cap
gun has a silver finish with bronze grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 9 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning, however the lever for loading caps
does not stay closed. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition with light surface scratches.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Leslie-Henry Wild Bill Hickok Cap Gun119

Three vintage Stevens "Buffalo Bill" toy cap guns. Items measure
roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The triggers and hammers seem to
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, cap compartment build-up, patina, and storage
wear such as light surface scratching is present. Additionally, the
cap compartment is loose on one of the items. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Buffalo Bill Cap Gun Lot of (3)120

LOT # QTY

A vintage Gene Autry Champion cap gun in a gold finish from the
1950's. Cap gun measures approximately 8 3/4" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present and the gold finish has started to wear. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Gene Autry Gold Champion Cap Gun121

A vintage Hubley Detective Special toy cap gun with original box
and six rounds of fake bullets.. Cap gun measures roughly 4" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems to function. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition however, storage wear such
as surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11950s Hubley Detective Special W/ Box122

A collection of two Italian made Edison Giocattoli cap guns from
the 1970's. Revolver measures approximately 9 1/2" from tip to end
of grip. The hammers and triggers are both functioning. Overall, the
cap guns are in great visual condition however, light surface
scratches are present. Please All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11970's Edison Giocattoli Cap Gun Lot (2)123

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan cap guns. The Texan
measures roughly 9" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on the
solid colored grip cap gun functions properly. Overall, both cap
guns are in great visual condition, however, slight rusting, an aged
patina and other signs of storage wear such as surface scratching
are present on both metal portions and grips. The hammer and
grips on the bull grip cap gun is slightly loose to fire. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Cap Gun Lot of (2)124

A vintage Stevens Peacemaker cap gun in a silver finish from the
1940's. Cap gun measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11940's Stevens Silver Peacemaker Cap Gun125

A vintage 1938 cast iron Stevens "Billy The Kid" toy cap gun. Cap
gun measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger no longer appears to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1938 Stevens Billy The Kid Cap Gun126
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A pair of vintage 1930's Gene Autry cap guns by Kenton. Guns
come in both a light and dark finish with varied grips. Cap guns
measures approximately 6 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition, however, light surface scratches are present on
both gun and grip as well as some wear and rust to the metal. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930's Gene Autry Cap Gun (2)127

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)128

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish with
pearl grips and bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12 3/4"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger do not function. Bullets
no longer smoke. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun129

A circa 1940s cast iron Hubley Army 45 toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 6 3/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger no longer seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is
in nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear
such as light surface scratching is present. Additionally, the bottom
portion of the left grip is broken. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11940s Hubley Army 45 Toy Cap Gun130

A vintage 1950's Roy Rogers pistol with silver finish done in a style
similar to Classy. Cap gun measures approximately 10 1/2" from
barrel tip to end of grip. The trigger functions well, however the
hammer does not click. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

11950's Classy Style Roy Rogers Cap Gun131

A vintage Hubley Wyatt Earp toy cap gun. Item measures roughly
11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function,
but upon pulling the trigger the gun will open it's cap compartment.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however, rusting,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see

1Vintage Hubley Wyatt Earp Toy Cap Gun132

LOT # QTY
photos for further details and conditions.

A vintage 1950's Pioneer cap gun by Hubley that comes with a
holster. Cap gun measures approximately 9 1/2" from tip to end of
grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is
in great visual condition, however,  light surface scratches are
present. Holster is in decent condition with signs of wear including
cracks and creases to the leather. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Pioneer Cap Gun W/ Holster133

A Daisy "1894" air rifle. Rifle measures approximately 38" from tip
to end of butt. The pump is air tight and hammer and trigger are
both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches and paint wear are present. See
pictures for further details and conditions.

1Daisy "1894" Air Pump Gun134

A vintage 25 Jr. cap gun by Stevens from the 1950's that comes
with original box. Cap gun measures approximately 4" from tip to
end of grip. The hammer and trigger both function, but hammer
does take a few tries to launch. Overall, the cap gun is in great
visual condition however, light surface scratches are present. Box
is in good condition with some signs of wear including a tear along
the flap. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Stevens 25 Jr. Cap Pistol W/ Box135

A vintage circa 1920s cast iron Kenton Magic single shot toy blank
shooter gun. Cap gun measures roughly 6 1/4" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger appears to still function. Overall, the cap
gun is in good visual condition however, an aged patina and
storage wear such as surface scratching are present. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11920s Kenton Magic Cast Iron Blank Shooter136

A collection of assorted cap gun caps from brands such as Kilgore,
Tiger, Nichols and more. Lot contains both cap rolls and empty cap
boxes. Conditions vary. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions. You get all
pictured.

1Assorted Cap Lot137

A vintage Leslie-Henry "Wagon Trail" cap gun. Item measures
roughly 10" from barrel to grip. The trigger and hammer seems to
function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition, however,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching are
present. Additionally, the cap compartment appears to have a
missing piece. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Leslie-Henry Wagon Train Toy Cap Gun138
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A vintage die cast Mountie cap gun by Kilgore that comes with
original box. Cap gun measures approximately 6" from tip to end of
grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is
in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. Box is in good condition with some signs of wear including
a tear along the flaps. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

1Vintage Die Cast Kilgore Mountie Cap Gun W/ Box139

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish with
white pearlescent grips and bullets. Cap gun measures
approximately 12 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
both function. Bullets no longer smoke. Overall, the cap gun is in
great visual condition however, light surface scratches are present.
See pictures for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun140

A pair of vintage 1950's Red Ranger cap guns by Wyandotte. Cap
guns have a Silver finish with marbled grips. Cap guns measures
approximately 8" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in great
visual condition however, light surface scratches are present.  All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11950's Wyandotte Silver Red Ranger Cap Gun141

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan cap guns. The Texan
measures roughly 9" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both cap guns function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in great
visual condition, however, slight rusting, an aged patina and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. Grips on both cap guns are slightly
loose. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Cap Gun Lot of (2)142

A collection of two vintage water pistols from circa the 1940's and
includes a Wyandotte #41. Wyandotte 41 measures 6 3/4" for
reference. Triggers appear to work for both pistols. Pistols are in
good visual condition, but also show wear and age with rust, paint
wear, scratches, and more. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Water Pistol Lot (2)143

An antique circa 1910s Stevens "Star" single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Antique 1910s Stevens "Star" Cap Gun144

LOT # QTY

A vintage Pony Boy cowboy holster set box from circa
1940's-1950's that contains an unmarked holster set with twin Pony
Boy cap guns. Pony Boy box is in decent to good visual condition
with signs of age and wear including tears, creasing, and
edgewear. Box measures 10 1/2"x 12 1/4". Holster set is unmarked
but in decent condition with visible wear including scratches and
discoloration to the leather and rhinestones. Pony Boy cap guns
measure 9 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip, with non functioning
triggers and hammers. Guns also experience different degrees of
wear. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Pony Boy Cowboy Outfit Holster W/ Guns145

A vintage Hubley "Cowboy" toy cap gun. Item measures roughly 11
1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function,
but upon pulling, the trigger often times becomes stuck. Overall,
the cap gun is in good visual condition, however, patina, and
storage wear such as light surface scratching is present. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Cowboy Toy Cap Gun146

A vintage 1930's Lasso Em' Bill cast iron cap gun by Kenton. Cap
gun has a painted finish with decorative jewels on the grips, though
three jewels are missing. Cap gun measures approximately 8 3/4"
from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Barrel rotates and contains one out of two bullets.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition but has surface
scratches, paint wear, and rust.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11930's Lasso Em' Bill Cast Iron Cap Gun147

Two vintage Stevens "25-Jr." cast iron toy cap guns. Items
measure roughly 4 1/4" from barrel to grip. The triggers seem to
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. Additionally, the cap compartment
grip is loose on one of the items. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930s Stevens 25-Jr. Cast Iron Cap Gun Lot of (2)148

A vintage 1950's Texas pistol by Leslie-Henry. Cap gun comes in a
silver finish with marbled grips. Cap gun measures approximately
9" from barrel tip to end of grip. The trigger and hammer function.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present.  All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Leslie-Henry Texas Cap Gun149
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A vintage Hubley Automatic toy cap gun. Item measures roughly 6
5/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however, rusting,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Automatic Toy Cap Gun150

A vintage 1950's Maverick 45 by Halco. Cap gun comes in a
bronze finish. Cap gun measures approximately 10 1/2" from barrel
tip to end of grip. The trigger and hammer function. Overall, the cap
gun is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches and
oxidization are present.  All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Halco Maverick 45 Cap Gun151

An antique 1895 cast iron Stevens "6-Shot" single shot toy cap
gun. Item measures roughly 6 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Antique 1895 Stevens 6-Shot Cast Iron Cap Gun152

A vintage 1940's Bulls Eye by Kenton. Cap gun comes in a silver
finish with sombrero carved grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 6 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The trigger and
hammer function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches and oxidization are present.  All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11940's Kenton Bulls Eye Cap Gun153

Two vintage circa 1950s Stevens "Bang-O" cast iron toy cap guns.
Items measure roughly 7 3/4" from barrel to grip. The triggers seem
to function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. Additionally, the grips on the green
gem cap gun is partially loose. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950s Stevens Bang-O Cap Gun Lot of (2)154

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Mark II toy cap gun in a silver finish
with black grips and bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12
3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger function. Bullets
no longer smoke. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 MII Cap Gun155

LOT # QTY

A vintage circa 1950s Kilgore Bronco toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 9" from barrel to grip. The hammer seems to function
properly, but the trigger is loose. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage 1950s Kilgore Bronco Toy Cap Gun156

A vintage 1950's  Hopalong Cassidy by Wyandotte with holster.
Cap gun has a silver finish with white and black grips that feature a
likeness of Hopalong Cassidy. Cap gun measures approximately 8
1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present. Holster is unmarked
and may not be of the same brand, but is in great condition. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

11950's Wyandotte Hopalong Cassidy W/ Holster157

An antique 1911 cast iron National toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 4 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and triggers seem
to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is present. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11911 National Toy Cap Gun158

A sealed, brand new in package set of metal play bullets for
Winchester or Fanner 50 by Mattel. Bullets are in excellent
condition as they are new in package. Card is in good condition
with some signs of wear including creasing and light discoloration.
Card measures 4 1/2"x 4 3/4". All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Mattel Metal Play Bullets/ Winchester & Fanner 50159

A vintage cast iron Kenton Buffalo Bill single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Buffalo Bill Toy Cap Gun160

A pair of vintage 1930's Gene Autry cap guns by Kenton. Guns
come in both a light and dark finish pearled grips. Cap guns
measures approximately 6 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, light surface scratches are present on
both gun and grip as well as some wear and rust to the metal. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and

11930's Gene Autry Cap Gun (2)161
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conditions.

A vintage Hubley Remington toy cap gun. Item measures roughly
8" from barrel to grip. The hammer seems to function, but the
trigger appears to no longer work. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Remington Toy Cap Gun162

A circa 1950's Texan Holster box that comes with holster and two
Texan cap guns by Hubley. Cap gun measures roughly 9 1/4" from
barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on both guns function.
Holster is in good condition with signs of wear including creases to
the leather. Holster may not be the exact set that came in box, but
is marked "Texan". Box is in good condition with some minor tears
along the corner creases. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Halco-Hubley Texan Holster Set W/ Cap Guns163

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in great
visual condition, however, slight rusting, an aged patina and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)164

A 1940's Bang-O cap gun by Stevens that comes with original box.
Cap gun measures approximately 7 1/2" from tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in good
visual condition however, surface scratches, discoloration and rust
are present. Box is in okay condition with signs of wear including
missing flaps, discoloration and staining. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11940's Stevens Bang-O Cap Gun W/ Box165

A vintage cast iron Kenton Persuader toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to
function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however,
rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11930s Kenton Persuader Toy Cap Gun166

A vintage 1950's Thundergun with silver finish by Marx. Cap gun
measures approximately 12" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, light surface scratches are present
and the silver finish has started to wear.  All cap guns have been

11950's Marx Thundergun Cap Gun167

LOT # QTY
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

Two vintage Kilgore cast iron Six Shooter cap guns. Both items
measure roughly 6 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
on both items seem to function. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, patina and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. Additionally, on one of the items there is a
loose portion of metal toward the top of the cylinder. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Six Shooter Cap Gun Lot of (2)168

A pair of two 1950's Hubley Texan Jr cap guns. Cap gun measures
roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on
both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, surface scratches are present on both metal
portions and grips and rust is apparent. The holster is unmarked
and may not necessarily match the cap gun but appears in good
visual condition with some leather wear including fading and
creasing and measures 33" in length. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot (2)169

A Daisy Buck Jones No. 107 air rifle. Rifle measures approximately
36 3/8" from tip to end of butt. The pump no longer appears to be
in a functioning state. Overall, the pump gun is in good visual
condition however, light surface scratches, scuffing, and paint wear
are present. See pictures for further details and conditions.

1Daisy Buck Jones No. 107 Air Pump Gun170

A vintage 1960's Wild Bill Hickok cap gun by Leslie-Henry. Cap
gun has a silver finish with bronze grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 9 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning, however the lever for loading caps
tends to come off track. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition with light surface scratches.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Leslie-Henry Wild Bill Hickok Cap Gun171

A vintage circa 1920s cast iron Kenton American Bull Dog single
shot toy cap gun. Item measures roughly 4" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger no longer appears to work as the barrel is
rusted open. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11920s Kenton American Bull Dog Toy Cap Gun172
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A 1940's Lone Ranger cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 8 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however, surface scratches, discoloration and rust are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11940's Kilgore Lone Ranger Cap Gun173

A vintage circa 1950s Service Mfg. Co Wyatt Earp toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, cap compartment build-up,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11950s Service Mfg. Co Wyatt Earp Toy Cap Gun174

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley cap guns, which includes a Texan
and a Texan Jr cap gun with blue replacement grips. The Texan
measures roughly 9 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger  on both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice
visual conditional, however, surface scratching is present on both
metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)175

An antique 1890 cast iron Stevens "Eagle" single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 6 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Antique 1890 Stevens Eagle Cast Iron Cap Gun176

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish and
bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 12 3/4" from barrel to
grip. The hammer and trigger function. Bullets no longer smoke.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun177

A vintage circa 1960s Mondial Rings Colt toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and triggers
seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, patina, paint chipping, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage 1960s Mondial Rings Colt Toy Cap Gun178

LOT # QTY

A pair of two 1950's Halco cap guns. Cap gun measures roughly 8
1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on both guns
function. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual condition,
however, surface scratches are present on both metal portions and
grips and paint wear has affected the finish. The holster is
unmarked and may not necessarily match the cap gun but appears
in great visual condition with some leather wear including and
creasing and measures 32" in length. Holster comes complete with
all six toy bullets. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

11950's Halco Cap Gun & Holster Lot (2)179

A vintage circa 1950s Actoy Wyatt Earp toy cap gun with holster.
Cap gun measures roughly 9" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. The holster is unmarked and
may not necessarily match the cap gun. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11950s Actoy Wyatt Earp Cap Gun & Holster Lot180

A vintage circa 1950's Roy Rogers Gold Forty-Niner cap gun by
Leslie-Henry in original box.  Cap gun measures approximately 9
1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches are present. Box is in good
condition with some signs of wear including edge wear and water
damage to both bottom box and cover. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions...

1Roy Rogers Gold Forty-Niner Cap Gun W/ Box181

A vintage Halco Marshal toy cap gun. Cap gun measures roughly
10 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems to
function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition
however, an aged patina and storage wear such as light surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Halco Marshal Toy Cap Gun182

A vintage 1950's Stallion 41-40 by Leslie-Henry that comes with
bullets. Cap gun comes in a silver finish with textured grips. Cap
gun measures approximately 9 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip.
The trigger and hammer function. Overall, the cap gun is in great
visual condition however, light surface scratches are present.  All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11950's Nichols Stallion 41-40 Cap Gun183
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Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan and Texan Jr. cap guns.
The Texan Jr. measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer
and trigger on both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in
good visual condition, however, rusting, an aged patina, and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. The tip of the hammer on the Texan
cap gun is broken off. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)184

A vintage Stevens Peacemaker cap gun from the 1940's. Cap gun
measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great
visual condition however, light surface scratches are present as
well as discoloration to the grip. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11940's Stevens Peacemaker Cap Gun185

A vintage circa 1930s cast iron Mordt toy cap & dart gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
appears to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Mordt Cap & Dart Gun186

A vintage circa 1920's President cast iron cap gun by Kilgore. Cap
gun measures approximately 8 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in good visual condition but has surface scratches, paint wear,
and rust.  All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11920's Kilgore President Cap Gun187

A vintage cast iron Kenton Persuader toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to
function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11930s Kenton Persuader Toy Cap Gun188

A vintage 1950's Eagle six shooter cap gun from the 1950's that
comes with original box. Cap gun measures approximately 7 3/4"
from tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning
and the barrel rotates. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. Box is in
good condition with some signs of wear including a dents and
creasing along the corner of both bottom box and cover. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions...

11950's Kilgore Eagle Cap Gun W/ Box189

LOT # QTY

A vintage 1938 cast iron Stevens "Billy The Kid" toy cap gun. Cap
gun measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger appears to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1938 Stevens Billy The Kid Cap Gun190

A variety of toy ammunition to be paired with Nichols and Hubley
cap guns. Conditions vary. You get all pictured.

1Nichols/Hubley Cap Gun Ammunition Lot191

Two vintage Coibel Luger toy guns. Both items measure roughly 7"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items seem to
function properly. Overall, both toy guns are in nice visual
condition, however, patina and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11980s Coibel Luger Toy Cap Gun Lot of (2)192

A vintage circa 1950's Fanner 50 cap gun by Mattel. Cap gun
measures approximately 10 1/2" from tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, surface scratches and paint wear
are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions...

11950's Mattel Fanner 50 Cap Gun193

A Giocattoli Panthermatic toy rifle. Rifle measures approximately
35" from tip to end of butt. The trigger seems to function properly.
Overall, this toy rifle is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches, scuffing, and paint wear are present. See
pictures for further details and conditions.

1Giocattoli Panthermatic Toy Rifle194

A vintage Nichols Stallion cap gun in a silver finish. Cap gun
measures approximately 7 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 32 Cap Gun195

A vintage Nichols Stallion 45 toy cap gun in a silver finish with
black grips. Cap gun measures approximately 12 3/4" from barrel to
grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Item does not come
with the accompanying bullets. Overall, the cap gun is in great
visual condition however, surface scratches and other signs of
storage wear are present. See pictures for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 45 Cap Gun196
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A vintage 1930's Gene Autry pistol cap gun. Gun comes in a silver
finish with semi-transparent grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 7 3/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition,
however, light surface scratches are present on both gun and grip.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930's Gene Autry Western Pistol Cap Gun197

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)198

A vintage 1939 Big Horn cap gun by Kilgore. Gun comes in a silver
finish with textured grips. Cap gun measures approximately 8 3/4"
from tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger function. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition, however, light surface
scratches are present on both gun and grip. Grips appear to have
been previously painted/customized and the paint job has begun to
wear. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11930's Kilgore Big Horn Cap Gun199

A vintage circa 1950s Marx Thundergun toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 12 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer seems
to function, but the trigger does not seem to work. Overall, the cap
gun is in nice visual condition, however, patina, and storage wear
such as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage 1950s Marx Thundergun Toy Cap Gun200

A complete vintage 1958 Hubley Colt 45 toy cap gun, with six
bullets and original packaging. Cap gun measures roughly 13" from
barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the
cap gun is in good visual conditional however, surface scratches
are present especially on the barrel. Packaging appears to be in
overall nice condition, but does exhibit storage wear as present
through scuffing, taped corners, and creasing. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

1Vintage Hubley Colt 45 Cap Gun W/ Original Box201

A vintage cast iron Stevens single shot Scout toy cap gun in a
silver finish with patented date of June 17, 1890. Cap gun
measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
both function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual

1Vintage Stevens Scout Cap Gun202

LOT # QTY
condition however, an aged patina, rusting, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A circa 1940s G Boy cap gun by Kenton. Item measures roughly 6
1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition, however, storage
wear such as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11940's Kenton G Boy Cap Gun203

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function properly, however, the darker gripped cap gun's
cap compartment opens upon firing. Overall, both cap guns are in
good visual condition, however, slight rusting, an aged patina and
other signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present
on both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)204

A collection of six holsters. Holsters vary in style and size with the
largest measuring 32" in length. Holsters appear in various
condition but all display forms of use including creasing, some
fading and discoloration, peeling and general leather wear. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions. You get all holsters pictured.

1Vintage Costume Holster Lot (6)205

A vintage circa 1950s Wyandotte Red Ranger toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 8 3/4" from barrel to grip. Overall, the cap gun is
in nice visual condition, however, patina, cap compartment
build-up, and storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. Additionally, the hammer and cap compartment opening
mechanism have loosened up and have fallen out. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11950s Wyandotte Red Ranger Toy Cap Gun206

A vintage 1910's Ideal Army cast iron toy gun. Gun measures
approximately 6 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger do not seem to function. Overall, the cap gun is in good
visual condition but has surface scratches, metal wear, and small
spots of rust. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11910's Ideal Army Cast Iron Gun207

Two vintage Hubley/Halco Bronco toy cap guns with accompanying
rounds of ammo. Both items measure roughly 11" from barrel to
grip. The hammer and trigger on both items seem to function

1Vintage Hubley/Halco Bronco Cap Gun Lot of (2)208
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properly. Overall, both toy guns are in great visual condition,
however, patina and storage wear such as surface scratching are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

A vintage 1938 six shooter cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 6 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition,
however, light surface scratches are present on both gun and grip
as well as age wear such a discoloration and patina to the metal.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11930's Kilgore Six Shooter Cap Gun209

An antique 1909 cast iron National toy gun. Item measures roughly
5" from barrel to grip. The hammer and triggers seem to function
properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however,
light rusting, patina, and storage wear is present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Antique 1909 National Cast Iron Cap Gun210

A vintage circa 1950's-1960's Ranger cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun
measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, surface scratches are present as
well as metal wear including erosion and patina. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions...

1Vintage Kilgore Ranger Cap Gun211

A vintage circa 1940s Kilgore Ranger toy cap gun with holster. Cap
gun measures roughly 8 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. The holster is unmarked and
may not necessarily match the cap gun. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear
such as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11940s Kilgore Ranger Cap Gun & Holster Lot212

A Daisy No. 95 air pump bb rifle. Rifle measures approximately 37
1/2" from tip to end of butt. The pump is air tight and hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in good visual
condition however, surface scratches and metal wear such as rust
are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

1Daisy No. 95 Air Pump BB Gun213

A vintage Stevens Cowboy King toy cap gun. Cap gun measures
approximately 9 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
both function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, surface scratches and other signs of storage wear are

1Vintage 1950s Stevens Cowboy King Toy Cap Gun214
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present. See pictures for further details and conditions.

A vintage circa 1920's President cast iron cap gun by Kilgore. Cap
gun has a silver finish. Cap gun measures approximately 8 3/4"
from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition but has
light surface scratches.  All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11920's Kilgore President Cap Gun215

A vintage 1928 cast iron Mordt Jr. Ranger .44 cal single shot toy
cap gun. Cap gun measures about 7 5/8" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger appears to function properly. Overall, the cap
gun is in nice visual condition however, an aged patina and storage
wear such as surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11928 Mordt Jr. Ranger .44 Cal Toy Cap Gun216

A vintage 1950's Thundergun with silver finish by Marx. Cap gun
measures approximately 12" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, light surface scratches are present
and the silver finish has started to wear.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11950's Marx Thundergun Cap Gun217

A Newell Airfire Sub-Machine toy gun which was produced in
Lowell, Michigan. Rifle measures about 25 1/2" from tip to end of
butt. Overall, this toy rifle is in good visual condition however, light
surface scratches, scuffing, and paint wear are present. See
pictures for further details and conditions.

1Newell Airfire Sub-Machine Toy Gun218

A vintage 1960's Wild Bill Hickok cap gun by Leslie-Henry. Cap
gun has a silver finish with ivory grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 9 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning, however the lever for loading caps is
broken/missing. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition
with light surface scratches and discoloration to the plastic grips.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11960's Leslie-Henry Wild Bill Hickok Cap Gun219

A vintage Stevens Safety 50 Shot toy cap gun. Cap gun measures
approximately 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
both function. Item does not come with the accompanying bullets.
Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition however, rusting in
the cap compartment, surface scratches and other signs of storage
wear are present. See pictures for further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1920s Stevens Safety 50 Shot Toy Cap Gun220
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A vintage 1950's Rin Tin Tin Pistol cap gun by Actoy. Cap gun has
a bronze finish and measures approximately 8 1/2" from barrel tip
to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches and small amounts of discoloration are present.
All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11950's Actoy Bronze Rin Tin Tin Cap Gun221

A vintage circa 1930s-1940s Kilgore Long Tom toy cap gun. Cap
gun measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger appears to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition however, an aged patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. Additionally, the two accompanying
grips are no longer on the toy gun. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Long Tom Billy The Kid Cap Gun222

A 1940's Lone Ranger cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 8 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however, surface scratches, discoloration and rust are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11940's Kilgore Lone Ranger Cap Gun223

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, rusting in the cap compartments, an
aged patina and other signs of storage wear such as surface
scratching are present on both metal portions and grips. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)224

A vintage 1950's Roy Rogers pistol with silver finish by Classy. Cap
gun measures approximately 10" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
trigger functions well, however the hammer does not click, nor does
the barrel stay closed. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present.  All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

11950's Classy Roy Rogers Cap Gun225

A circa 1930s cast iron Stevens Cowboy single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 12" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and

11930s Stevens Cowboy Toy Cap Gun226
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conditions.

A vintage 1920's Federal cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 5 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger are non functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however light surface scratches and metal wear are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11920's Kilgore Federal Cap Gun227

A collection of forty cap gun grip pieces for brands such as Halco,
Hubley, Nichols, Kenton, and more. Complete grip pairs are not
guaranteed. All pieces vary in condition. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pieces pictured.

1Assorted Cap Gun Grips (40 pieces)228

A pair of two 1950's Kilgore Roy Rogers cap guns. Cap gun
measures roughly 8 3/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and
trigger on both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, surface scratches are present on both
metal portions and grips. The holster appears in good visual
condition with some leather wear including fading and creasing and
measures 31" in length. Holster comes complete with all six toy
bullets. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

1Vintage Kilgore Roy Rogers Cap Guns & Holster Lot229

A vintage 1936 Kenton Texas toy repeater cap gun. Cap gun
measures approximately 6" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition
however, paint chipping, surface scratches, and other signs of
storage wear are present. See pictures for further details and
conditions.

11936 Kenton Texas Toy Repeater Cap Gun230

A 1931 Western cap gun by Kenton. Item measures roughly 7"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition, however, storage wear
such as light surface scratching is present as well as metal wear
and rust. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11930's Kenton Western Cap Gun231

A vintage circa 1940s Kilgore Ranger toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 8 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition however, the cap compartment is rusting, patina,
and storage wear such as light surface scratching are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage 1940s Kilgore Ranger Toy Cap Gun232
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A vintage 1890 Lion Face cap gun by Stevens. Item measures
roughly 5 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both
function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition, however,
storage wear such as light surface scratching as well as metal wear
and rust are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11890 Stevens Lion Face Cap Gun233

A vintage Kenton "Blank Shooter" single shot toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 6" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Blank Shooter Cast Iron Cap Gun234

A pair of two 1950's Halco cap guns. Cap gun measures roughly 8
1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on both guns
function. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual condition,
however, surface scratches are present on both metal portions and
grips and paint wear has affected the finish. The holster is
unmarked and may not necessarily match the cap gun but appears
in good visual condition with some leather wear including and
creasing  and cracking, and measures 34" in length. Holster
appears to be missing toy bullets. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Halco Cap Gun & Holster Lot (2)235

A vintage cast iron Stevens single shot Scout toy cap gun in a
silver finish with patented date of June 17, 1890. Cap gun
measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
both function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina, rusting, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Scout Toy Cap Gun236

A vintage circa 1950's Fanner 50 cap gun by Mattel. Cap gun
measures approximately 10 1/2" from tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
good visual condition however, surface scratches and paint wear
are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions...

11950's Mattel Fanner 50 Cap Gun237

A vintage circa 1950s Gene Autry Smokey Joe Champion toy cap
gun. Cap gun measures roughly 9" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition however, the cap compartment is rusting,
patina, and storage wear such as light surface scratching are

11950s Gene Autry Smokey Joe Champion Cap Gun238
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present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

A Daisy Red Ryder air pump bb rifle. Rifle measures approximately
36" from tip to end of butt. The pump is air tight and hammer and
trigger are both functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in good visual
condition however, surface scratches and metal wear such as rust
are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

1Daisy Red Ryder Air Pump BB Gun239

Two vintage circa 1940s Stevens Pluck and Big Chief mini toy cap
guns. Both items measure roughly 3 5/8" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger on both items seem to function properly.
Overall, both toy guns are in nice visual condition, however,
rusting, patina and storage wear such as surface scratching are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Stevens Pluck & Big Chief Mini Cap Guns Lot of (2)240

A pair of two 1950's Hubley Texan Jr cap gun. Cap gun measures
roughly 9 1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on
both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in nice visual
condition, however, surface scratches are present on both metal
portions and grips. The holster is unmarked and may not
necessarily match the cap gun but appears in good visual condition
with some leather wear including paint wear and creasing. Holster
measures approximately 31" in length. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Hubley Texan Jr Cap Gun & Holster Lot (2)241

A vintage Hubley "Cowboy" toy cap gun. Item measures roughly 11
1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger no longer seems
to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition, however, patina, paint chipping, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Cowboy Toy Cap Gun242

A vintage 1950's Roy Rogers cap gun by Schmidt. Cap gun
measures approximately 9 1/2" from tip to grip. The hammer and
trigger are both functioning, however barrel has trouble staying
closed after firing. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
with some wear including surface scratches. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Schmidt Roy Rogers Cap Gun243

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan and Texan Jr. cap guns.
The Texan Jr. measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer
and trigger on both items function. Overall, both cap guns are in

1Vintage Hubley Texan & Texan Jr Cap Gun Lot of (2)244
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good visual condition, however, rusting, an aged patina, and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. The tip of the hammer on the Texan
cap gun is broken off. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

A vintage Nichols Stallion 38 cap gun in a silver finish. Cap gun
measures approximately 9 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual
condition however, light surface scratches are present. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 38 Cap Gun245

An antique 1890 cast iron Stevens "Eagle" single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 7 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Antique 1890 Stevens Eagle Cast Iron Cap Gun246

A collection of six toy bullets to be paired with the Colt 45 Hubley
cap guns. Bullets come used with all their shells. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions. You get all pictured.

1Hubley Cap Gun Ammunition Lot247

A vintage Hubley Automatic toy cap gun. Item measures roughly 6
5/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seem to function.
Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however, rusting,
cap compartment build-up, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Automatic Toy Cap Gun248

A vintage 1940's Bulls Eye by Kenton. Cap gun comes in a dark
finish with sombrero carved grips. Cap gun measures
approximately 6 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The trigger and
hammer function. Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition
however, light surface scratches and oxidization are present.  All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions..

11940's Kenton Bulls Eye Cap Gun249

A vintage Halco/Leslie-Henry "Maverick 45" toy cap gun in a bronze
finish and comes with all accompanying bullets. Item measures
roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer, trigger, and cylinder
all seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition, however, patina, paint chipping, and storage wear such
as surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11950s Halco/Leslie-Henry Maverick 45 Toy Cap Gun250
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A collection of eleven holsters and belts. Holsters and belts vary in
style and size with the largest measuring 34 1/2" in length.
Costume pieces appear in various condition but all display forms of
use including creasing, some fading and discoloration, peeling and
general leather wear. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions. You get all
pieces pictured.

1Vintage Costume Holster and Belt Lot (11)251

A Daisy No. 25 BB gun from circa 1970s. BB gun measures
approximately 36 1/2" from tip to end of butt. The pump no longer
appears to be in a functioning state. Overall, the BB gun is in good
visual condition however, wear such as surface scratches, scuffing,
and paint wear are present. See pictures for further details and
conditions.

11970s Daisy No. 25 BB Gun252

A vintage 1950's Maverick 45 by Halco. Cap gun comes in a
bronze finish. Cap gun measures approximately 10 1/2" from barrel
tip to end of grip. The trigger and hammer function. Overall, the cap
gun is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches and
oxidization are present.  All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Halco Maverick 45 Cap Gun253

An antique 1922 Kilgore "Long Boy" single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. Additionally there seems to be a split
in the barrel. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11922 Kilgore Long Boy Toy Cap Gun254

A vintage 1935 Border Patrol cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun
measures approximately 4 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
trigger and hammer non functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition however, surface scratches and metal wear are
present.  All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11930's Kilgore Border Patrol Cap Gun255

A 1932 cast iron Stevens "Six Shot" single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer, trigger,
and cylinder all seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11932 Stevens Six Shot Cast Iron Cap Gun256

A vintage 1930's Dandy cap gun by Hubley. Cap gun measures
approximately 5 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition,

11930's Hubley Dandy Cap Gun257
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however, surface scratches are present as well as age wear such a
discoloration and patina to the metal. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

A vintage Kenton "Blank Shooter" single shot toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 6" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Blank Shooter Cast Iron Cap Gun258

A 1931 Western cap gun by Kenton with a dark finish and
decorative jewel. Item measures roughly 7" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger both function, though trigger guard is partially
broken. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however,
storage wear such as surface scratching is present as well as metal
wear and rust. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions..

11930's Kenton Western Cap Gun259

Two vintage Hubley Champ cap guns. Items measure roughly 5"
from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items function
properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual condition,
however, an aged patina and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present on both metal portions and grips. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Champ Cap Gun Lot of (2)260

An antique 1922 Kilgore "Long Boy" single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, storage wear such as light surface scratching is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11922 Kilgore Long Boy Toy Cap Gun261

A vintage circa 1940s Stevens "Buffalo Bill" toy cap gun with
original box. Items measure roughly 8" from barrel to grip. The
trigger and hammer seems to function properly. Overall, both items
are in good visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage
wear such as surface scratching, scuffing, and tearing in the box is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Stevens Buffalo Bill Cap Gun W/ Box262

A 1940's Lone Ranger cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 8 1/4" from tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual
condition however, surface scratches, discoloration and rust are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see

11940's Kilgore Lone Ranger Cap Gun263
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photos for further details and conditions..

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, rusting in the cap compartments, an
aged patina and other signs of storage wear such as surface
scratching are present on both metal portions and grips. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)264

A vintage 1930's Whizzer cap gun by Kilgore that comes with
Mattel brand caps. Cap gun measures approximately 4 1/4" from
barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and crank function. Overall,
the cap gun is in great visual condition, however, light surface
scratches are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions..

11930's Kilgore Whizzer Cap Gun W/ Caps265

An antique 1910 cast iron National toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 5" from barrel to grip. The hammer and triggers seem to
function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is present. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions.

11910 National Cast Iron Toy Cap Gun266

A vintage 1950's Gene Autry cap gun by Leslie-Henry that comes
in original box. Cap gun measures approximately 8 3/4" from barrel
to grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the
cap gun is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches
are present. Box is in good condition with signs of age and storage
wear including creasing and discoloration. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11950's Leslie-Henry Gene Autry Cap Gun267

A vintage circa 1950s Kenton "Bulls Eye" toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 6 3/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Bulls Eye Toy Cap Gun268

A collection of three retro toy guns including a Screaming
Mee-mee-e pistol which measures 15 1/4" for reference and a Han
Solo Blaster. Toy guns are used and in visually good condition with
visible signs paint wear and playwear. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Retro Toy Gun Lot (3)269
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An antique 1920s National "Old Ironside" single shot toy cap gun.
Item measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
trigger seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such
as light surface scratching is present. Additionally there seems to
be a split in the barrel. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11920s National Old Ironside Toy Cap Gun270

A collection of two airsoft guns including a M21 and a CYMA
P.618. Both guns come with partial packaging and with airsoft BBs.
M21 measures approximately 8 1/2" for reference. Airsoft guns are
in great to excellent condition with little to no playwear. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions.

1Airsoft Gun Lot (2)271

Two vintage Hubley Trooper cap guns. Items measure roughly 6
5/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger on both items
function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in good visual
condition, however, slight rusting, patina and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present on both metal portions and grips. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Trooper Cap Gun Lot of (2)272

A vintage 1940's 49er cap gun by Stevens that comes with original
box. Cap gun measures approximately 9" from tip to end of grip.
The hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. Box is in good condition and includes a tear the right-side
of the box. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions...

11940's Stevens 49er W/ Box273

An antique 1922 cast iron Andes Master cast iron toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 4 5/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and
triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice
visual condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear is
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11922 Andes Master Cast Iron Toy Cap Gun274

A pair of two 1950's Halco-Hubley Marshal cap guns. Cap gun
measures roughly 10 3/8" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and
trigger on both guns function. Overall, both cap guns are in good
visual condition, however, surface scratches are present on both
metal portions. The holster is marked Marshal and may not
necessarily match the cap gun but appears in good visual condition
with some leather wear including fading and creasing. Holster
measures 31 7/8" in length and comes with four toy bullets. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. All cap guns have been

11950's Halco-Hubley Marshal & Holster Set (2)275
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presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

A vintage circa 1950s Stevens "Pioneer" toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, patina, and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950s Stevens Pioneer Toy Cap Gun276

A vintage 1939 Rex cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 3 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Gun appears to be missing a piece near the
hammer. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however,
surface scratches are present as well as rust and age wear such a
discoloration and patina to the metal. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11930's Kilgore Rex Cap Gun277

A vintage Nichols Stallion 41-40 toy cap gun in a silver finish with
white grips. Cap gun measures approximately 10 3/4" from barrel
to grip. The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present. See pictures for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 41-40 Cap Gun278

A vintage 1935 Invincible cap gun by Kilgore. Cap gun measures
approximately 5 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition,
however, surface scratches are present as well as wear such a
discoloration and patina to the metal. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11930's Kilgore Invincible Cap Gun279

A vintage 1931 cast iron Kenton Buffalo Bill single shot toy cap
gun. Item measures roughly 13 1/4" from barrel to grip. The
hammer and trigger no longer seem to function properly. Overall,
the cap gun is in nice visual condition, however, rusting, patina,
and storage wear such as light surface scratching is present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Buffalo Bill Toy Cap Gun280

A single-shot vintage 1925 Bunker Hill cap gun by National. Cap
gun measures approximately 5 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip.
The hammer and trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in good
visual condition, however, surface scratches are present as well as
wear such a discoloration and patina to the metal. All cap guns
have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details
and conditions..

11920's National Bunker Hill Cap Gun281
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A vintage Mattel Fanner toy cap gun. Cap gun measures about 9
2/3" from barrel to grip. The hammer, trigger, and cylinder all seem
to function properly, though does take a bit of effort. Overall, the
cap gun is in nice visual condition however, patina, paint chipping
and storage wear such as light surface scratching are present. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Mattel Fanner Toy Cap Gun282

A vintage Nichols Stallion 32 cap gun in a silver finish that comes
in its original box with bullets. Cap gun measures approximately 7
1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger both function.
Overall, the cap gun is in great visual condition however, light
surface scratches are present. Box is in great condition with edge
wear near the seams. All cap guns have been presumably fired. All
cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for
further details and conditions.

1Vintage Nichols Stallion 32 Cap Gun W/ Box283

Two vintage circa 1950s Hubley Texan Jr. cap guns. The Texan Jr.
measures roughly 8 1/4" from barrel to grip. Hammer and trigger on
both items function properly. Overall, both cap guns are in great
visual condition, however, slight rusting, an aged patina and other
signs of storage wear such as surface scratching are present on
both metal portions and grips. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage Hubley Texan Jr. Cap Gun Lot of (2)284

A vintage Kilgore The American cap gun that comes in its original
box. Cap gun measures approximately 9 1/2" from barrel to grip.
The hammer and trigger both function. Overall, the cap gun is in
great visual condition however, light surface scratches are present.
Box is in great condition with edge wear near the seams. All cap
guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos for further
details and conditions..

11940's Kilgore The American Cap Gun W/ Box285

A vintage circa 1940s Kenton "C-Boy" toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 6 1/2" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as
surface scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11940s Kenton C-Boy toy Cap Gun286

A vintage 1950's Maverick 45 by Halco. Cap gun comes in a silver
finish. Cap gun measures approximately 10 1/2" from barrel tip to
end of grip. The trigger and hammer function. Overall, the cap gun
is in great visual condition however, light surface scratches are
present.  All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

11950's Halco Maverick 45 Cap Gun287
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A 1925 Kenton Wild West single shot toy cap gun. Item measures
roughly 11 1/4" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger seems
to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual condition,
however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light surface
scratching is present. Additionally there seems to be a split in the
barrel. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions.

11925 Kenton Wild West Toy Cap Gun288

A vintage single-shot 1929 Two Time cap gun by Kenton. Cap gun
measures approximately 9 1/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The
hammer and trigger are both functioning. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition but has surface scratches as well as metal
wear including patina and rust.  All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11920's Kenton Two Time Cap Gun289

A vintage circa 1950s Gene Autry Champion toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures roughly 9" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching are present. Additionally, both grips are slightly
loose. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

11950s Gene Autry Champion Cap Gun290

A vintage 1960's Lone Star Luger cap gun. Cap gun has a black
painted finish. Cap gun measures approximately 7 1/2" from barrel
tip to end of grip. The hammer and trigger are both functioning.
Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition but does show
signs of paint wear as well as surface scuffs.  All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11960's Lone Star Luger Cap Gun291

A vintage Italian FVM "Montana Jack" twelve shot toy cap gun with
original box. Item measures roughly 10" from barrel to grip. The
trigger, hammer, and cylinder all seem to function properly. Overall,
both items are in good visual condition, however, patina, paint
wear, and storage wear such as surface scratching, scuffing, and
tearing in the box is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

1Vintage FVM Montana Jack 12 Shot Cap Gun W/ Box292

A vintage 1930's Dandy cap gun by Hubley. Cap gun measures
approximately 5 3/4" from barrel tip to end of grip. The hammer and
trigger function. Overall, the cap gun is in good visual condition,
however, surface scratches are present as well as age wear such a
discoloration and patina to the metal. All cap guns have been
presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions..

11930's Hubley Dandy Cap Gun293
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A vintage Kenton "Western" single shot toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 7" from barrel to grip. The hammer has been
previously broken so the trigger cannot be pulled. Overall, the cap
gun is in nice visual condition however, rusting, patina, and storage
wear such as surface scratching are present. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

1Vintage Kenton Western Toy Cap Gun294

A circa 1950's-1960's Crosman 140 air rifle. Rifle measures
approximately 34 3/4" from tip to end of butt. The pump is air tight,
but does not always shoot. Hammer and trigger are both
functioning. Overall, the pump gun is in good visual condition
however, surface scratches and metal wear such as rust are
present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see
photos for further details and conditions..

1Crosman 140 Air Rifle295

An antique 1922 Kilgore "Long Boy" single shot toy cap gun. Item
measures roughly 11" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition, however, rusting, patina, and storage wear such as light
surface scratching is present. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11922 Kilgore Long Boy Toy Cap Gun296

A vintage "Sambo" style cast iron, caricature head gun from 1887.
Gun measures approximately 4 1/2" from barrel tip to end of grip.
Gun is in visually nice condition with signs of age and wear
including patina, and spots of erosion and rust. All cap guns have
been presumably fired. Please see photos for further details and
conditions.

11887 "Sambo" Style Cast Iron Gun297

A vintage circa 1950s Stevens "Pioneer" toy cap gun. Cap gun
measures about 8" from barrel to grip. The hammer and trigger
seems to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in nice visual
condition however, patina, and storage wear such as surface
scratching are present. All cap guns have been presumably fired.
Please see photos for further details and conditions.

11950s Stevens Pioneer Toy Cap Gun298

A circa 1950's Texan Holster box by Halco that comes with holsters
and two Texan cap guns by Hubley. Cap gun measures roughly 9
1/4" from barrel tip to grip. The hammer and trigger on both guns
function. Holsters are in great visual condition with small signs of
wear including creasing to the leather. Holster may not be the exact
set that came in box. Box is in good condition with some minor
tears along the corner creases. All cap guns have been presumably
fired. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please see photos
for further details and conditions.

1Halco The Texan Holster Set W/ Cap Guns299
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An antique 1887 cast iron Stevens figural Lion cast iron toy cap
gun. Item measures roughly 5 1/8" from barrel to grip. The hammer
and triggers seem to function properly. Overall, the cap gun is in
nice visual condition, however, light rusting, patina, and storage
wear is present. All cap guns have been presumably fired. Please
see photos for further details and conditions.

11887 Stevens Lion Figural Toy Cap Gun300
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